BID SUMMARY: S$-7904-W3

SURPLUS VEHICLES - WPD

Surplus Vehilces & Equipment:

S-7904-W3

Corkery Berlin Auto
Item # - Description Tractor Trailer Parts| James Ciru
1-2011 Ford Crown Vic no bid $651.00 no bid
2-2011 Ford Crown Vic no bid $275.00 no bid
3 - 2011 Ford Crown Vic no bid $275.00 no bid
4 - 2010 Ford Crown Vic no bid $150.00 no bid
5-2011 Ford Crown Vic no bid $275.00 no bid
6 - 2007 Ford Crown Vic no bid $275.00 no bid
7 - 2008 Ford Crown Vic no bid $275.00 no bid
8- 2008 Ford Crown Vic no bid $275.00 no bid
9 - 2011 Ford Crown Vic no bid $275.00 no bid
10 - 2011 Ford Crown Vic no bid $275.00 no bid
11 - 2008 Ford Crown Vic no bid $275.00 no bid
12 - 2011 Ford Crown Vic no bid $275.00 no bid
13 - 2011 Ford Crown Vic no bid $275.00 no bid
14 - 2011 Ford Crown Vic no bid $275.00 no bid
15 - 2011 Ford Crown Vic no bid $651.00 no bid
16 - 2009 Ford Taurus no bid $457.00 no bid
17 - 2008 Ford Taurus no bid $225.00 no bid
18 - 2009 Ford Taurus no bid $557.00 no bid
19 - 2005 ForD Crown Vic no bid $275.00 no bid
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20 - 2008 Ford Taurus no bid $250.00 no bid
21 - 2006 Ford Crown Vic no bid $275.00 no bid
22 - 2008 Ford Taurus no bid $557.00 no bid
23 - 2009 Ford Taurus no bid $557.00 no bid
24 - 2008 Ford Taurus no bid $557.00 no bid
25 - 2008 Ford Taurus no bid $557.00 no bid
26 - 2009 Ford Taurus no bid $557.00 no bid
27 - 2008 Ford Taurus no bid $557.00 no bid
28 - 2009 Ford Taurus no bid $557.00 no bid
29 - 2007 Nissan Maxima $129.00 $457.00 no bid
30 - 2004 Lexus ES330 $389.00 $457.00 no bid
31 - 2007 Acura RDX $289.00 $275.00 no bid
32 - 2011 Chevy Equinox $589.00 $655.00 no bid
33 - 2000 Lexus ES300 $189.00 $455.00 no bid
34 - 2012 Nissan Altima $789.00 $557.00 no bid
35 - 2005 Toyota Avalon $129.00 $457.00 no bid
36 - 199 Toyota Camry $129.00 $425.00 no bid
37 - 2008 Honda Accord $489.00 $557.00 no bid
38 - Crown Vic Parts (lot) no bid no bid no bid
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38 - 2005 Honda Odyssey $389.00 $575.00 $500.00
39 - 2006 Ford Explorer $513.00 $675.00 no bid
40 - 2014 Nissan Altima $1,389.00 $1,255.00 | $1,200.00
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