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 ADMINISTRATION & FINANCE 

PURCHASING DIVISION 
 

 
 
DATE:  April 25, 2022 
 
BID NO:  S-7798-W2 
 
 
SUBJECT:  Surplus Vehicles / WFD 
 
 
Bidder:     Item 1: Item 2: Item 3: 
Joseph Lennerton   no bid  no bid  $ 3,850.00 
Berlin Auto Parts, Inc.  $ 635.00 $ 635.00 $ 1,775.00 
Brooks Brothers UAP   $ 253.00 $ 253.00 $ 1,673.00 
Joel Bain   no bid   no bid $ 1,250.50 
Jeffrey Sobol   $ 31.00  $ 31.00  $ 1,051.00 
Corkery Tractor Trailer  $ 20.00  $ 125.18 $   789.44 
Solomon Aryee   no bid  $ 500.00 no bid 
   
 
 
 


	PURCHASING DIVISION
	DATE:  April 25, 2022
	BID NO:  S-7798-W2
	SUBJECT:  Surplus Vehicles / WFD

