ADMINISTRATION & FINANCE
PURCHASING DIVISION

DATE: September 10, 2025

BID NO: CR-8255-W5

SUBJECT:  Truck & Roll-Off Container Services / DPW

Please be advised that bids have been received from the following companies:

Bidder: Item 1 (30 yd): Item 2 (25-29 yd):  # of Units:
Eagle Eye Contracting $125.00 $120.00 2
Parent Landscape & Const. $130.00 $125.00 4
Soojian Services $130.00 no bid 1
Superior Waste & Recycling $145.00 $140.00 4
Barrows Paving no bid $124.75 2
Barrows Trucking no bid $125.00 3
A & A Antiques no bid $138.00 1
Falcone Enterprises no bid $140.00 2
Haddad Enterprises no bid $140.00 4
Al’s Rubbish & Container no bid $140.00 3
Richard R. Record & Son no bid $140.00 ?
Favreau Forestry $ 305.00 (50 yd) no bid 1
Very truly yours,

Christopher J. Gagliastro
Purchasing Director
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