BID # CR-8695-J6 CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY  Bidder Nama:w S)

CR-8695-J6 - Custodial Supplies / City - Pricing Sheet

GROUP 1- BIDDER MUST BID ALL ITEMS WITHIN GROUP 1. AWARD TO BE BASED ON THE GRAND TOTAL
GROUP 2 - WILL BE AWARDED BY LINE ITEM. BIDDERS MAY BID ON ANY OR ALL ITEMS WITHIN THIS GROUP

**Please Download and Submit Pricing via USB Thumb Drive with bid Submission**

GROUP 1 - BIDDER MUST BID ALL ITEMS WITHIN GROUP 1. AWARD TQ BE BASED ON THE GRAND TOTAL

PERFORMANCE SPECIFICATION NOTICE
Any manufacturer / brand names or standards identlified in this bid are meant to establish a minimum performance standard. Or-equal products
from other manufacturers and/or brands that meet the standards listed are acceptable. The City shall solely make the determination as to
products meeting the minimum performance standard. Vendors are encouraged to include product literature with their bid submission to verify

product compliance.
|ESTIMATED|
ITEM #] ANNUAL UNIT DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER PART # UNIT § JOTAL
QUANTITY |

(=Y

: e

0 | | e e | Chaspion AzeResy s 330 |+ 223.00 -
2| 5 | cms | ECOSPROEcobracasodorsiminator, | Cpeffye | ROOATRERZ. (9,4 |5 a7 28
e Each | ToiletBowl Cleanezr“woltzh Bleach, Scented, C\‘m M“ 2,3{ § ?Z' Z(

5207_.

o Each | Al-Purpose Cleaner (Spray) With Bleach, Crﬂdﬂcﬂ& 0LD R 3 ,?? s 37 ? p) 0 )

(2]

1

Scented, 32 oz

5 i Case | Disinfoctant Claa:’eé'avzlethaleach. 128 oz, M M A0 | L{QD‘C)D

e | 6 | o | Compumc e e | C Joige(h | CLOwMA 25715 |+ 3575

1§ Each Spot & Stain Spray Carpet Cleaner, 32 oz Cf‘eq,%fvb c-ZI/0 $ /' 70 - |3 3& SD

I~

1 gal Bottle, 4/Carton

15 Case |Z2oP Commercial High Traffic Carpet Cleaner, Crc‘;{»'ﬁ,e XTQP(CTW s 2?'?0 s q;;l 0

320z, 12 ct

N 5 " Lysol, All-Purpose Cleaner Spray, Cfax‘\’ Ve ﬁ)me 22|, 3({‘% . /7/‘ w

0| 6 | cme | Forenctorrinens o ot | ractoiGole FERREEN. 20 (7). (33,10

n 20 Case diaross Ba(s:zb :::‘:::2)" per - 2,02 Mm _(LM - [ 2- $ 3?;2? $ 78\§ &D .

§ gal. Pail, Scented

12 T pail | Betco Ax-t® Plus No-Rinse Floor Stripper, Ie ‘ e w: ({ 5'7_( P, C{ 32 S'D .
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CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY  Bidder Name:__|O 0 W)?

BID # CR-8695-J6
| o | e | semmonmormmsmeu | [pesel | THIOUST: 38.60|0 BEg,00
6| w0 | cue |Feeerteeontvewemsciner | Qigmomd] | GRANOEY |+ 26D |+ | 240,00
5| 5 | ome [Fmuesncimer coyeme e Cgfibe | DBE321: 2096 |+ 149,90
w| @ | o | e anesme. | ACS | FOCEMY. 298D, /197,00
2| 5 | cme | Prowermimoseensn, | Chese |Y33-UIoL | (), 20| 206,00
1 - Each | Palmolive Dlshwa;shlgzg Liquid, Scented, ‘.Pmo(,ﬂaf 2'65 " 7?‘ 5‘0 :
18 20 Each Triple Action Dish Detergent Orange 52 oz UE" w:s Hé‘ﬂ* 2 » ,S'D L] Sb,w T
. 4 Each TolletSeat(::;esr, Dlapanser, 17.26 343 _&?QO Tz s 1220 |* é / SO
National Chemical Laboratories Surge™
ase eavy-Du u rain ner, 0z, th ‘—.‘—’.—.@ 03 »
2| 10 |e¢ Heavy-Duty Liquid Dain Oponer, 32 Cfﬂi(;t DRATNOSP, Y é.{‘i ’?76’5'0
]
22 5 Case Bloc Aid Drain Cleaner, 1 Gal, 4/Carton M m § (// . 7¥ 3 2(8,70 :
2| @ | cue |soogmomm oo s e, | Crastive: | NEUTY |2 2230 |» |368,00
w | w0 | een | “erngsoutan o rmaroms | Quiasel | TARBEAT: 6. 0D | 120,60
1 Gal, Scented
°
s | o | cue | WindexAmmonioclasscomrsore. | Cyreghive) GLASSZZ{ §,10 |« [62:0D
o
2 20 S Windex Glas; ;‘:el:ta:;r.'wg;Ammonla-D, Cf'&ﬂ'ﬂ]& Géﬁg"‘ " 6’ 20 . Izl{'w
a| o || compesmmmacmmomm | QuSilennl KKERO|. 20% | (99,80
a| | e | ot samaom e | Ao | GNER-SZ|, 3,10 |2 (20,00
a| o || o | Creofive| Hauosmo), 8.057|. ¢p,25”
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BID # CR-8695-J6

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY  Bidder Name: / jE glﬁ 2% —gb'@ 7

w| v || e | LUTOC AR 30 | 99,00
st 25 | coss [santizer,Rom,vane, ot roomin, scaren| _KOTOL- | KU=SUb |, 4.9 |

/0] s
2| 78 | G | S Cortod oaming tand Sou /gkw KEUSH |« ez |- 239,75
| o | e | e | Glde  CPHUD). 290 |+ gpo0
] w0 | e | Sotemmeveson | OTpMeN0| SOPTY | 290 |+ 39000
36| s | Each Trash Grabber 36" Langth Sedreo | GRrbRERY . 14.21 |+ 7/0.sD
3| 5 | o | emmcnmomuenmcn | Chose. | DMOPIE | 2450 |+ 94,00 -
2| 0| o | v vaoo sy | DT | BE8YB |2 90 15 |+ 94/ 0D
2| | oue [Smmeiemeommamar ol ScoTl | 25730\, 389 | 12314
n | o | ome |wmmnssemnmononer | MOT [ SCRBY [, 1500 | (0,20
a| m | oo | rowswnsmwme | SANZCO | @eRUSH (. 37| (f 75
| o | cme | utomscrens scomas,omon | zgndd-Llewy VRSCREEAS 7. 8D |+ 399,00
a| w | ow | oo |Clorie .| CLX-fS . SIS, 12760
@ || o | e s | LMl Bunlelle 2oBWIREE: 20,65 |+ 260,50
s | 10 | ce | Corbmnieng e scom, 70 //{*%g@m* 3150 [* 245,00
s | 15 | cuse |SWScotn e zoo ScrmenScrus Sponge, ;.%Lb.&zﬁ‘m"ﬁm 3.9¢ (.25
a| o | o sy | Tideo meze | 90 99,00
g | o | cme| Sosmisweswmasposs | ACS | SCoa. (957 |s B
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B1D # CR-8695-J6 CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY  Bidder Name: ﬁ /V@ 7L

Rubbermald Commercial HYGEN r-40 O ,
48 20 Case | Recycled Microfiber Cloths, 16" x 18", Blue, M ¥ Z,g-" ¥
24/Pack 2 A GS:CD
|Professional Lysol Advanced Deep Clean All- :I Ef
49 0 Case Purpose Cleaner Spray, Scented, 32 oz, A P ve - % R $ .
21,
12/Carton
|5
Professional Lysol Disinfectant Heavy-Duty Q_ﬁﬁ:{u@ gb
50 - e Bathroom Cleanar, Scented, 1 Gal _QEKC{ i Z ) / A’D.
Lysol Clean & Fresh Multi-Surface Cleaner, %i@‘
81 18 Case Sparkling Lemon & Sunflower Essence m 5 3}2‘@ $ o{ ?6 a)
Scent, 144 oz, 4/Carton L '
/
Marcal Facial Tissue (Recycled), 2-Ply, Cﬂﬁs'}dm e ? ?
k2 & — 100 Tissues/Box, 30 Boxes/Carton r ﬂj P $201 | /g 7 . .3: S =
Kleenex Trusted Care Facial Tissue, 2-Ply, QMM ST G
8| 2 | Coue 160 Tissues/Box, 6 Boxes/Pack i s 9,20 |+ 265,00

; Bounty Egssentials Select-A-Size Paper
54 30 Case | Towols, 2-Ply, White, 108 Sheets/Roll, 12 MIJE/ &Iﬁz}dﬁ s J250-/ 32(‘0@ :
Rolls/Carton (1,296 Sheets) 124zt - 252004 235 / : y

™

55 " Each | C10FoxPro Germicidal Bleach, Concantratad, S'C ';!&HEE’" .[;ZX-—SD?G&I : 7. ?8 s 3??’ OD

121 floz
TOTAL - ALL ITEMS GROU! E
Award Based on this amour : :23( 2& %‘

GROUP 2 - BIDDER MAY BID ANY OR ALL ITEMS. AWARD TO BE BY LINE ITEM.
See Pages 12-14 of Bid Documents for Specifics on Group 2 ltems
The items provided shall be designed to universally fit all standard paper towel and toilet tissue dispensers

(A SATANREA TN oW LT TR PN T T s

Any manufacturer / brand names or standards identified In this bid are meant to establish a minimum performance standard. Or-equal products
from other manufacturers and/or brands that meet the standards listed are acceptable. The City shall solely make the determination as to

| products meeting the minimum performance standard. Vendors are encouraged to include product literature with their bid submission to verify

FEAR, [FEF RPN IE RS
TIMATED
ITEM #| ANNUAL UNIT DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER PART # UNITS TOTAL
QUANTITY |

1 40 CASE PAPER TOWELS (DPF) Mdfﬂ!_ .ﬂ&m / & ?I 5 7\5’ 2 s qD

2 10 CASE TOILET TISSUE (DPF) _@QIBI',QH_ m s /z \{5” s /7& S‘@

3 100 | CASE PAPER TOWELS (DPRC) M’ ~§30l |, [ Q.cfé s lq%‘oo

4 l1ao CASE TOILET TISSUE {DPRC, FIRE, IT) Mﬂ’m_ M 5 335? 5 60%?. GD

Pricing Pages (April 2026) 40of 5



BID # CR-8695-J6 CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY  Bidder Name: ‘ Qﬁ ,A_/OM 'gf?

s | a0 | case T C_ﬂ}ﬂ‘almnI;QE‘{ﬁ@lze s fg2) | 77,72 R0
o | @ | oase PAPER TOWELS (1) iolille GO-28124. 59 99|: 2999.D
1| w |ome| owewowmspown | KiwlabCup KC25021. 92,48 |- Y409,00
| w o | rowrmsseocen | JHareed RAVIRTIZ. 2574) | | 285D,$D
N [ eenrowisonn (Yl BIMVETT ff 2] 337.50

w| o |oe|  ewmronesomm | Dacel | NO-miEwws. (23] |- 94,05~
I O eI (o Cryshiluors pl-6500E8 22,9 |- 14,50 -
R e =TSl (o b YzsRese, Y690 | 224,50
w| s | oase OILET TISSUE (OPW Movesn| SRY1¢0 |+ 20,00+ (3,80

TOILET TISSUE (DPW) ﬁhﬂlw $ 5‘;'?0 $ 292:00 :

INY  NON-LISTED [TEMS REQUIRED TO BE
PROCURED FROM THE SELECTED VENDOR MAY BE
PURCHASED BY THE CITY AT A RATE NOT TO
IXCEED 10% OVER THE VENDOR'S NET COST. THE
[ITY SHALL CONDUCT RANDOM PRICE AUDITS TO
/ERIFY COMPLIANCE WITH THIS PROVISION.
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BID # CR-8695-J6

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY

Bidder Name: WB .M son

The guoted prices must be all-inclusive, covering the cost of the items as woell as all dellvery and associated ¢charges

CR-8695-J6 - Custodial Supplies / City - Pricing Sheet

GROUP 1- BIDDER MUST BID ALL ITEMS WITHIN GROUP 1. AWARD TO BE BASED ON THE GRAND TOTAL
GROUP 2 - WILL BE AWARDED BY LINE ITEM. BIDDERS MAY BID ON ANY OR ALL ITEMS WITHIN THIS GROUP

**Please Download and Submit Pricing via USB Thumb Drive with bid Submission**

GROUP 1 - BIDDER MUST BID ALL ITEMS WITHIN GROUP 1. AWARD TO BE BASED ON THE GRAND TOTAL

PERFORMANCE SPECIFICATION NOTICE

Any manufacturer / brand names or standards identified in this bid are meant to establish a minimum performance standard. Or-equal products
from other manufacturers and/or brands that meet the standards listed are acceptable. The Cly shall solely make the determination as to
products meeting the minimum performance standard. Vendors are encouraged to Include product literature with their bid submission to verify

product compllance.
ESTIMATED
ITEM #| ANNUAL UNIT DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER PART # UNIT § TOTAL
QUANTITY

SJIN391465

1 60 Each F°b'°:°r'e:’::':'f";“'":::;9 ::’“"' Ll Glade *Priced in bid UoM, 1.65 99.09
Sl BER 1 9.8 0z item sold as 7.3 oz
for $1.37

2 5 Case | ECOSPRO EcoBraeze Odor Eilminator, ECOS Pro EFPPLIBA0E 28.95 144 75

Scented, 32 oz, 6/Case ——— 2l e
3 35 Each Tollet Bowl CIeane;4w;;h Bleach, Scented, Clorox CLOGD031 277 96.95
4 100 Eachif | DusRose Cléanor (Spray) With Blsach, Fantastik SJN308685 4.42 442.00

Scented, 32 oz
s 20 Cane Disinfectant Cleaner with Bleach, 128 oz, Clorox CLO35420 46.31 026.20
4/Case S 000%
Clorox Ultra Clean Toilet Tablets, Bleach

] 5 Case Scent, 3.5 oz, 2/Pack, 6/Carton Clorox CLC30024PK 42.50 212.50

NCL067636
7 16 Each Spot & Stain Spray Carpet Cleaner, 32 oz NCL *Priced in bid UoM, i 51,16

item sold as 12/CS
for $40.93
Zep Commercial High Traffic Carpet Cleaner,
8 15 Case 1 gal Bottle, 4/Carton NCL NCL 180028 36.69 550.35
Lysol, All-Purpose Cleaner Spray,
9 5 Case 32 oz, 12 ot Lysol RACT75352 55.60 278.00
Febreze, Odor-Fighting Fabric Refresher,
10 & Case Scented, 23.6 oz, 4/Carton Eebraze PGCO8%05 22.40 112.00
11 20 Case e e Stipper, 20 oz Betco BCC0992300 58.31 1,166.20
{12 per case)

12 10 Pail Betco Ax-It® Plus No-Rinse Floor Stripper, NCL NCL105821 68.78 687.80

§ gal. Pati, Scented = B e
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BID # CR-8695-J6

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY

Bidder Name: w B

Spartan On an' On High Solids Metal
13 10 Pall Interlock Floor Finish, § Gallon NCL NCL059121 82.38 8§23.80
Fabuloso Professlonal All-Purpose Cleaner
14 50 Case & Degreaser, Scented, 1 Gal, 4/Carton Fabuloso CPC05253 44 60 2,230.00
Formula 409 Cleaner Degreaser Disinfectant
15 5 Case Spray, Unscented, 32 oz, 12/Carton Formula 409 CLO35306CT 48.43 242.15
Degreaser Cleaner - Green Seal certifled ,
16 40 Case 1 Gal, 4/Carton NCL NCL403529 36.56 1,462.40
Professional Lysol Disinfectant Spray,
17 5 Case Scented, 19 oz, 12/Carton Clorox CLO38504 75.96 379.80
18 30 Each | Dt D""""“;:g'z“ LICIS S ceniad: Palmalive CPC463 2.53 75.90
19 20 Each Triple Action Dish Detergent Orange 52 oz Ajax CPC49860 4.20 84.00
IMP1122CT
20 5 Each | TolletSeat E‘;‘fs' ':s"r:’;::’;:a:: ZE L Impact *Priced in bid UoM, 10.89 54.43
o item sold as 2/CT for
$21.77
National Chemical Laboratories Surge™
21 10 Case Heavy-Duty Liquid Drain Opener, 32 oz, NCL NCL176045 30.09 300.90
12/CS
NCL176045
22 5 Case Bloc Aid Draln Cleaner, 1 Gal, 4/Carton NCL *Priced in bid Uoh, 40.12 200.60
item sold as 32 oz,
12/CS for $30.09
Betco pH7 Daily Floor Cleaner Concentrate,
22 60 Case Scented,1 Gal Bottle, 4/Carton NCL NCL93529 25.93 1,555.80
Mr. Ciean Professional All Purpose Floor
24 20 Each Cleaning Solution for Finished Floors, Mr. Clean PGCO2621 17.10 342.00
1 Gal, Scented
S.JN322338
26 20 Case | WINdex ‘;’"'“':";’;DZG"’;g';’""' Spray, Windex *Priced in bid UoM, 14.59 291.80
RS e Oz e Anon item sold as 8/CT for
$29.18
2 20 eachll B Clegnecyitn ammcnis D Windex SJINB9B503 9.55 191.00
Scented, 1 Gal p——- T g =
Genuine Joe Aerosol Glass Cleaner,
27 5 Case Unscented, 19 oz, 12/Case NCL NCL2002 36.96 184.80
NWLENGAPFS /
Powder-Free Exam Gloves, 4 Mil, Nitrile, NWLENGAPFM /
28 200 ESX Biue or Black, 100/Per Box {All Sizes) WB Mason NWLENGAPFL / AE 22
NWLENGAPEXL

Pricing Pages (April 2026)
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BID # CR-8695-J6 CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY Bidder Name:
PURELL Advanced Hand Sanltizer
29 5 Each Refreshing Gel, Scented, 1.5 L Purell GOJ501504 13.79 68.95
30 10 Each LT TE AT LT Purell GOJB42401 14.74 147.10
- electronic (700-mil gel soap) —— p———
G0.J646302
31 25 Case | Sanitizer, Refill, Hand, Gel {700mil), 3/Carton Purell *Priced in bid UoM, 33.77 844.16
item sold as 1200
mL, 2/CS for $38.59
Scott Green Certified Foaming Hand Soap
32 75 Case Refill, Unscented, 1.2 L, 2/Carton Scott KCC91591 36.99 2,774.25
Softsoap Antibacterial Liquid Hand Soap,
33 35 Each Scented, 11.25 oz Softsoap CPC44571 3.44 120.40
Softsoap Moisturizing Liquld Hand Soap
34 50 Each Refill, Scented, 128 oz Softsoap CPCO01075 15.52 776.00
35 50 Each Trash Grabber 36" Length Impact IMP3706 23.77 1,188.50
Diversey Cong-r-Dust Dust Mop/Dust Cloth . 353.00
36 J Ca88 | raatment, Scented, 170z Aerosol, 12/Carton R DvO90azst J0.60 :
Scott Shop Towels Original, 9" x 12, Blue,
R 1,055.10
1 U Case | 00/Box, 8 Boxes/Carton (1,600 Sheets) Scott KCC75190 105.51 2
Scott Shop Towels Original, Blue, 9.4" x 11"
i y ) 164.7
=4 L e 55/Roll, 30 Rolls/Carton (1,650 Sheats) colt BLLIEIER LA 110075
Scott Rags in A Box All-Purpose Towels, 9"
39 5 Case x 12°, White, 200 Towels/Box Scott KCC75260 13.19 65.95
40 25 Each Toilet Brush, 16 in., White NexStep 0CDYe301 2.12 53.00
HOS03901
L 3] 50 Case Urinal Screens, Scented, 6/Box Hospeco “Priced in bid UoM, 9,97 498.25
item sold as 12/DZ
for $19.93
Clorox Disinfacting Wipes Value Pack,
8 728.80
42 50 Cise Scented, 35 Wipes/Canister, 3/Pack Lysol Sheamie a1 8
RAC77182
Clorox Bleach Free Disinfecting Wipes, *Priced in bid UoM,
X .B1
8 10 case Scented, 76 Wipes/Canistor, 6/Carton Lysol item sold as 80 2208 202
wipes, 8/CT for
$25.26
44 10 Casoll | oox Disiniacting Wipss; Scented 700 Clorox CLO31428 62.10 621.00

Wipesi/Canister, 2/Carton

Pricing Pages (April 2026)
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BID # CR-B695-J6 CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY Bidder Name:
45 15 Case 3M Scotch-Brite Zero Scratch Scrub Sponge, M MMM5295 $ 739 110.85
9/Pack b
Mr. Clean Professional Magic Eraser, Extra
46 0 Case | " power Disposable Cleaning Pads, 30/CT Mr. Cloan £GC16449 $ s 22815
7 5 Case S0 S A1 Surfsceiecibbepbpongs. S.0.. cLosiotz | s 12.67 62.85
12iCarton
Rubbermald Commercial HYGEN r-40
48 20 Case | Recycled Microfiber Cloths, 16" x 16”, Blue, Rubbermaid RCP1820583 $ 20.90 418.00
24/Pack
Professlonal Lysol Advanced Deegp Clean All-
49 30 Case Purpose Cleanar Spray, Scented, 32 oz, Lysal RAC00351 3 55.90 1,677.00
12/Carton
Professional Lysol Disinfectant Heavy-Duty
5e 2 it Bathroom Cleaner, Scented, 1 Gal Lysol BACS4201 3 L) SLEC
Lysol Clean & Frash Multl-Surface Cleaner,
51 15 Case Sparkling Lemon & Sunflower Essence Lysol RAC?7617 3 37.49 562.35
Scent, 144 oz, 4/Carton
Marcal Facial Tissue {Recycled), 2-Ply,
52 5 Gase 100 Tissues/Box, 30 Boxes/Carton Marcal MRCNPS701 | § 2 030
Kleenex Trusted Care Faclal Tissue, 2-Ply,
52 % S 180 Tissues/Box, 6 Boxes/Pack sl KCL54306 s .28 28808
Bounty Essentials Selaect-A-Size Paper
54 30 Case Towels, 2-Ply, White, 108 Sheets/Roll, 12 Bounty PGC11093 $ 18.18 545.40
Rolls/Carton (1,296 Sheets)
55 50 Each CloroxPro Germicidal Bleach, Concentrated, Clorox CLO30966 s 7.23 361.50
121floz e
- L ITEM ROUP 1
TOTAL - ALL ITEMS G 29,386.35

Award Based on this amount*

GROUP 2 - BIDDER MAY BID ANY OR ALL ITEMS. AWARD TO BE BY LINE ITEM.

See Pages 12-14 of Bid Documents for Specifics on Group 2 items
The items provided shall be designed to universally fit all standard paper towel and toilet tissue dispensers

PERFORMANCE SPECIFICATION NOTICE

Any manufacturer/ brand names or standards identified in this bid are meant to establish a minimum performance standard. Or-equal products
from other manufacturers and/or brands that meet the standards listed are acceptable. The City shall solely make the determination as to
products meeting the minimum performance standard. Vendors are encouraged to include product literature with thelr bid submission to verify

product compliance.
ESTIMATED
ITEM#| ANNUAL UNIT DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER PART # UNIT§ TOTAL
QUANTITY
1 40 CASE PAPER TOWELS (DPF) Marcal MRCPZ00N $ 18.03 721.20
Pricing Pages (April 2026) 40f5
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item sold as 550
SHT/RL, 80 RL/CT
for $65.30

BID # CR-8695-J6 CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY Bidder Name:
2 10 CASE TOILET TISSUE (DPF) Morcon MOR129X 16.00 160.00
2 100 | case PAPER TOWELS {DPRC) Georgia-Pacific GPC20389 30.65 3,965.00
4 180 | cASE TOILET TISSUE (DPRC, FIRE, IT) Marcal MRC05002 35.60 6.408.00
5 450 | CASE PAPER TOWELS (FIRE) Genuine Joe GJO21120 19.92 8.964.00
8 s0 | case PAPER TOWELS (IT) Georgia-Pacific GPC28124 55.10 2,755.00
7 50 CASE PAPER TOWELS (POLICE) Scott KCC25702 87.90 4,395.00
8 50 CASE TOILET TISSUE (POLICE) Scott KCC07827 57.90 2,895.00
9 30 CASE PAPER TOWELS {DPW) Georgia-Pacific GPC21000 36.48 1,094.40
10 5 CASE PAPER TOWELS (DPW) Georgia-Pacific GPC23304 32.89 164.45
1 5 CASE PAPER TOWELS (DPW) Mrocon MORWG800 24.35 121.75
12 5 CASE TOILET TISSUE {(DPW) Alliance Paper ALIC42882SC 43.42 247.10
13 5 CASE TOILET TISSUE {DPW) Morcon MORM9 22.99 114.95
GPC1988001
14 5 CASE TOILET TISSUE {DPW) Georgia-Paclfic | ced in bid UoM, 40.16 200.80

IANY  NON-LISTED ITEMS REQUIRED TO BE
PROCURED FROM YHE SELECTED VENDOR MAY BE
PURCHASED BY THE CITY AY A RATE NOT 7O
EXCEED 10% OVER THE VENDOR’'S NET COST. THE
CITY SHALL CONDUCT RANDOM PRICE AUDITS TO
VERIFY COMPLIANCE WITH THIS PROVISION.

Pricing Pages (April 2026)
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Aieild -
BID # CR-8695-J6 CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY  Bidder Name: C%j'w eal

CR-8695-J6 - Custodial Supplies / City - Pricing Sheet

GROUP 1- BIDDER MUST BID ALL ITEMS WITHIN GROUP 1. AWARD TO BE BASED ON THE GRAND TOTAL
GROUP 2 - WILL BE AWARDED BY LINE ITEM. BIDDERS MAY BID ON ANY OR ALt ITEMS WITHIN THIS GROUP

"*Please Download and Submit Pricing via USB Thumb Drive with bid Submission**

The quoted prices must be ali-inclusive, covering the cost of the items as well as all delivery and associated charges

GROUP 1 - BIDDER MUST BID ALL ITEMS WITHIN GROUP 1. AWARD TO BE BASED ON THE GRAND TOTAL

PERFORMANCE SPECIFICATION NOTICE

Any manufacturer / brand names or standards identified in this bid are meant to establish a minimum performance standard. Or-equal products
from other manufacturers and/or brands that meet the standards listed are acceptable. The CHy shall solely make the determination as to
products meeting the minimum performance standard. Vendors are encouraged to include product literature with their bid submission to verify

product compllance.
lESTIMATED
ITEM #] ANNUAL UNIT DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER PART # UNITS TOTAL
QUANTITY

1 60 Each Febroze, Odor-Eliminating Aerosol Air SPARTAN 6019-00 $ 554 | s 3264
- Freshener, Scented, 8.8 oz

2 3 Case | FCOSPRO EcoBreeze Odor Eliminator, SPARTAN 305303 $ 53211 15964
= Scented, 32 oz, 6/Case

3 35 Each Tollet Bowl Cleanezr‘w;tzh Bleach, Scented, CLOROX 00021 $ 405! s e
4 100 Each All-Purpose Cleaner {Spray) With Bleach, CLOROX 35417 $ 797|s S

Scented, 32 oz
5 20 Case Disinfoctant Cleaner with Bleach, 128 oz, CLOROX 68978 $ 12767 s —
4/Case
Clorox Ultra Clean Toilet Tablets, Bleach i
-] 1 Case Scent, 3.5 oz, 2/Pack, 6/Carton STEARNS 2708961 3 4232 | s 4232
7 15 Each Spot & Stain Spray Carpet Cleaner, 32 oz SIMONIZ M2265012 $ 293|% 4389
Zep Commercial High Traffic Carpet Cleaner, -
8 15 Case 1 gal Bottle, 4/Carton SIMONIZ C0520004 $ 3303 (s A5 50
Lysol, All-Purpose Cleaner Spray, =
8 5 Case 32 oz, 12 ct SPARTAN 3147-03 $ 5914 | s 295 B
Febreze, Odor-Fighting Fabric Refresher, )
10 4 Case Scented, 23.6 oz, 4/Carton FEBREZE 07309 $ 8354 | s 33415
Asrosol Baseboard Stripper - 20 oz ~ i
n 20 Case {12 per case) SPARTAN 6097-00 $ 3651 s 1.330 78
Betco Ax-It® Plus No-Rinse Floor Stripper,
12 10 Pail 5 gal. Pail, Scented SPARTAN 0082-05 5 8410 | s 84058
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Bidder Name: [/]&C _?E’ H'/] } ﬂ,}/l a (

BID # CR-8695-J6 CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY
Spartan On an’ On High Solids Metal
13 10 Pail interlock Floor Finish, § Gallon SPARTAN 5473-05 115.46 1154 58
Fabuloso Professional All-Purpose Cleaner
14 50 Case & Degreaser, Scented, 1 Gal, 4/Carton SIMONIZ C0669004 54.99 274960
Formula 409 Cleaner Degreaser Disinfectant
15 5 Case Spray, Unscented, 32 oz, 12/Carton SIMONIZ N2635012 44 97 224 84
16 27 Cage | DegreaserCleaner-Groen Seal certified, | o0\ ¢ repy 13005 103.73 280060
1 Gai, 4/Carton
Professional Lysol Disinfectant Spray,
17 5 Case Scented, 18 oz, 12/Carton SPARTAN 6076-00 73.61 368 06
18 30 Each Patmolive Dlshwazsahi(r;zg Liquid, Scented, SIMONIZ A0195012 230 e
19 20 Each Triple Action Dish Detergent Orange 52 oz SPARTAN 7648-04 6.87 137 48
Toilet Seat Cover Dispenser, 17.25 x 3.13 x
20 5 Each 11.75, Smoke Black SCA 1951001 15.69 78.47
National Chemical Laboratories Surge™
21 10 Case Heavy-Duty Liguid Drain Opener, 32 oz, SIMONIZ 02449012 41.29 412 86
12/CS
22 5 Case Bloc Aid Drain Cleaner, 1 Gal, 4/Carton SPARTAN 7380-04 58.65 29323
Batco pH7 Daily Floor Cleaner Concentrate,
23 60 Case Scentad,1 Gal Bottle, 4/Carton SIMONIZ P2666004 23.07 1.384.32
Mr. Clean Professional All Purpose Floor
24 20 Each Cleaning Sotution for Finished Floors, SPARTAN 0019-04 12.49 249 80
1 Gal, Scented
Windex Ammonia-D Glass Cleaner Spray,
25 7 Case Scented, 32 oz, 4/Carton SIMONIZ B0400012 27.33 191.30
Windex Glass Cleaner with Ammonia-D,
26 20 Each Scented, 1 Gat SIMONiZ B0400004 5.3 106 12
Genuine Joe Aerosol Glass Cleaner,
27 5 Case Unscented, 19 oz, 12/Case SPARTAN 6217-00 56.29 281.47
Powder-Free Exam Gloves, 4 Mil, Nitrile,
= ) — Blue or Black, 100/Per Box (Al Sizes) SR G e ik
PUR H
29 5 Each URELL Advanced Hand Sanitizer GOJO 5015-04 18.40 o168

Refreshing Gel, Scented, 1.5L

Pricing Pages (April 2026)
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BID # CR-8695-J6

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES I/ CITY

Bidder Name:

10

Each

Sanitizer, Hand,touch free dispenser,

electronic (700-mil gel soap} GQJO 8720-01 (Manuat} 1988 158 B0
31 19 Case | Sanitizer, Refill, Hand, Gel {700mil), 3/Carton GOJO 8703-04 66 42 1361 90
Scott Green Certified Foaming Hand Soap 4612-00 (No \
32 = E— Refill, Unscented, 1.2 L, 2/Carton SR Dispensers Needed) o) waaz
Softsoap Antibacterial Liquid Hand Soap, 5710-06 T
33 L Each Scented, 11.25 0z (E0He (7.5 02) 242 1
Softsoap Moisturizing Liquid Hand Soap -
34 50 Each Refill, Scented, 128 oz SIMONIZ £50225004 10.50 525 00
35 50 Each Trash Grabber 36" Length UNGER NT0S0 36.34 1,817.20
Diversey Cong-r-Dust Dust Mop/Dust Cloth
6 & e Treatment, Scentad, 170z Aerosol, 12/Carton SIMONIZ S3374012 130 G
Scott Shop Towels Original, 9" x 12", Blue, e
£ 18 Case | ~200/Box, 8 Boxes/Carton (1,600 Sheets) Mo 868848 84.92 A
Scott Shop Towels Original, Blue, 9.4" x 11", e
38 28 Case | gsiRoll, 30 Rolls/Carton (1,650 Sheets) Mol 868848 84,52 sl
Scott Rags In A Box All-Purpose Towels, 9"
3 4 ass X 12", White, 200 Towels/Box MDI 93102 82,80 St
40 25 Each Toilet Brush, 15 in., White RUBBERMAID FG631000WHT 531 13265
41 28 Case Urinal Screens, Scented, 6/Box HOSPECO AWUS007-BX 23.18 579 60
Clorox Disinfecting Wipes Value Pack,
2 2 S Ll Scented, 35 Wipes/Canister, 3/Pack SPARTAN 1086-08 81.24 e
Clorox Bieach Free Disinfecting Wipes,
8 6 e Scented, 75 Wipes/Canister, 6/Carton SR AL il ks .
Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, Scented, 700
44 19 Case Wipes/Canister, 2/Carton SPARTAN 1086-06 81.24 154280
45 15 Case 3M Scotch-Brite Zerco Scratch Scrub Sponge, aM 529.5 10.01 e
9/Pack
Mr. Clean Professional Magic Eraser, Extra
48 5 e Powar Disposable Cleaning Pads, 30/CT el L) Ll 486
8.0.8. All Surfa
47 5 Case Sl R R G BRILLO W240000 6.12 3058

12/Carton

Pricing Pages (April 2026)
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BID # CR-8695-J6

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY  Bidder Name: (. 17010V IGY

]

Case

Rubbermaid Commercial HYGEN r-40

Recycled Microfiber Cloths, 16™ x 16", Biue, MONARCH MFC3001616BL 9.86 394 40
24/Pack
Professional Lysol Advanced Deep Clean All-
49 30 Case Purpose Cleaner Spray, Scented, 32 oz, SPARTAN 3147-03 59.14 177408
12/Carton
Professional Lysol Disinfectant Heavy-Duty
50 20 Each Bathroom Cleaner, Scented, 1 Gal SPARTAN fhiats 4.66 2
Lysol Clean & Fresh Multi-Surface Cleaner,
51 15 Case Sparkling Lemon & Sunflower Essence SPARTAN 0040-04 53.87 808 .08
Scent, 144 oz, 4/Carton
Marcal Facial Tissue (Recycled), 2-Ply,
52 g L 100 Tissues/Box, 30 Boxes/Carton e LAl SLE ) 19985
Kleenex Trusted Care Facial Tissue, 2-Ply,
5 e e 160 Tissues/Box, 6 Boxes/Pack LA LIRS SAEE o
Bounty Essentials Select-A-Size Paper
54 16 Case Towels, 2-Ply, White, 108 Sheets/Roll, 12 SCA HE1930A 40.63 650.05
Rolls/Carton {1,296 Sheets)
55 50 Each CloroxPro Germicidal Bleach, Concentrated, CLOROX 30966 11.21 e

124 floz

TOTAL - ALL ITEMS GROUP 1
Award Based on this amount*

39,235 22

GROUP 2 - BIDDER MAY BID ANY OR ALL ITEMS. AWARD TO BE BY LINE ITEM.
See Pages 12-14 of Bid Documents for Specifics on Group 2 ltems
The items provided shall be designed to universally fit all standard paper towel and toilet tissue dispensers

[l =Y almi

TERTORWMANCE JFECIFR AT RIN WO TICE
Any manufacturer / brand names or standards Identified in this bid are meant to establish a minimum performance standard. Or-equal products
from other manufacturers and/or brands that meet the standards listed are acceptable. The City shall solely make the determination as to
products meeting the minimum performance standard. Vendors are encouraged to include product literature with their bid submission to verify

mdurl.annnlhm

ESTIMATED
ITEM #] ANNUAL UNIT DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER PART # UNIT § TOTAL
QUANTITY
1 40 CASE PAPER TOWELS (DPF) No Bid No Bid
2 10 CASE TOILET TISSUE (DPF) Na Bid No Bid
3 100 CASE PAPER TOWELS (DPRC) o Bid No Bid
4 180 CASE TOIWLET TISSUE {DPRC, FIRE, IT) No Bid No B

Pricing Pages (April 2026)
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Bidder Name: ( Z{ b

Pricing Pages (April 2026)

BID # CR-8695-J6 CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY
s 450 CASE PAPER TOWELS (FIRE) No Big Hios B
[ 50 CASE PAPER TOWELS (IT) No Big W Bid
7 50 CASE PAPER TOWELS (POLICE) No Big Wa Bid
8 50 CASE TOILET TISSUE {POLICE) No 8id o Bid
9 30 CASE PAPER TOWELS (DPW) No Bid o Bt
10 5 CASE PAPER TOWELS (DPW) No Bid Mo Bid
1t 5 CASE PAPER TOWELS (DPW) Mo Bid No Bid
12 5 CASE TOILET TISSUE {DPW) bl Bied ro Bid
13 5 CASE TOILET TISSUE (DPW) Mo Bl Ho Bal
14 5 CASE TOILET TISSUE (DPW) N B Mo Bid
ANY NON-USTED ITEMS REQUIRED TO BE
PROCURED FROM THE SELECTED VENDOR MAY BE
PURCHASED BY THE CITY AT A RATE NOT TO
EXCEED 10% OVER THE VENDOR'S NET COST. THE
CITY SHALL CONDUCT RANDOM PRICE AUDITS TO
VERIFY COMPLIANCE WITH THIS PROVISION.

Sof &
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BID # CR-8695-J6 CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES /CITY  Bidder Name:

CR-8695-J6 - Custodial Supplies / City - Pricing Sheet

GROUP 1- BIDDER MUST BID ALL ITEMS WITHIN GROUP 1. AWARD TO BE BASED ON THE GRAND TOTAL
GROUP 2 - WILL BE AWARDED BY LINE ITEM. BIDDERS MAY BID ON ANY OR ALL ITEMS WITHIN THIS GROUP

**Please Download and Submit Pricing via USE Thumb Drive with bid Submission**

The guoted prices must ba all-inclusive, covering the cost of the items as well as all delivery and assoclated charges

GROUP 1 - BIDDER MUST BID ALL ITEMS WITHIN GROUP 1. AWARD TO BE BASED ON THE GRAND TOTAL

PERFORMANCE SPECIFICATION NOTICE
Any manufacturer / brand names or standards identified in this bid are meant to establish a minimum performance standard. Or-equal products
from other manufacturers and/or brands that meet the standards listed are acceptable. The City shall solely make the determination as to
products meeting the minimum performance standard, Vendors are encouraged to include product literature with their bid submission to verify

product compliance.
ESTIMATED
ITEM #| ANNUAL | UNIT CRIP MANUFAGTURER PART # UNITS TQTAL
QUANTITY |
Febreze, Odor-Eliminating Aerosol Air /'ﬂﬁ c7pnt - Cortug /S FGEE
1 L =4 Freshener, Scented, 8:8-ox = . < Z W S 232 Lo
Led ot P T e X ¥ X2
s
ECOS PRO EcoBreeze Odor Eliminator, Loraier A & -F2 S oS i 1
2 & Caat Scented, 32 oz, 6/Case LI e ME DS N I
3 a5 Each | Tollet Bowl Cleaner with Bleach, Scented, | 7, - .. Y s |
24 02 F.e) Sos 35T
All-Purpose Cleaner (Spray) With Bleach, (f Lol o X FE5 7
4 g Eac Scented, 32 oz - : G ) SGE-C
Disinfectant Cleaner with Bleach, 1280z, | (.o . F5vze
5 20 Case 4/Case £ ) Eryss ' SeeF ve
Clorox Ultra Clean Tollot Tablets, Bleach | /7, .o . . Feoze
§ § Case Scent, 3.5 oz, 2/Pack, 6/Carton Yool g 223.60
’ &
SoLvE 7 e .
7 15 Each Spot & Staln Spray Carpet Cleaner, 32 oz /ﬁ H o - |8 1
Ao K,y A &5 rZL 6
Zop Commerclal High Traffic Carpet Cleaner,| 7 .- - FUHTCi2E
g l Chas 1 gal Bottle, 4/Carton - —_— i |t ’7/ 7 co” ¥ & 3o e
Lysol, All-Purpose Cleaner Spray, Lysee Ve vt A
9 5 Case 5 - |8 : e
32 0z, 12 ct ek AP o4 s S 5
10 5 Case Fel:arozeé Od:r:lg:t;ng F:::élc Refresher, /y crzrer Canied & £9¢ 3 . e )
cented, 23.6 oz, 4/Carton = 275D ’37
1 20 Case Aerosol Baseboard Stripper - 20 oz EAS S 3E-I 2 5
{12 per case) STy e Y RL S eeg. e
'
Betco Ax-It® Plus No-Rinse Floor Stripper, BT EL S B i
12 1 — & gal. Pail, Scented Leres A% LR 8 9745 |3 9750
Pricing Pages (April 2026) 10f5




CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / GITY  Bidder Name: (-2 /o Y2 e

BID # CR-8695-J6
13 10 Pail Spartan On an’ On High Solids Metal T ol -8 25757 . )
— Interlock Floor Finlsh, 5 Gallon e = S8 J&L Fo
.7 !
Fabuloso Professional All-Purpose Cleaner g 525
14 50 Case Lotgd 7z fewyse| _ Y2253 s :
& Degreaser, Scented, 1 Gal, 4/Carton 2 - 7‘/ G0 2,9//7 -
Formula 409 Cleaner Degreaser Disinfectant 8 Lo0s; F5T20
15 § Case Leedex 20k L J-
Spray, Unscented, 32 oz, 12/Carton Y B30 LS. e
1% 40 Case Degreaser CI:ag:: -4(’;‘;::: r?mal certified , 7.:,‘5_, e - 5 7_ 4 v s P 72-%_. y
ECc-Logo CELTIFIEN vl A
Professlional Lysol Disinfectant Spray, L ¥sar THELp
17 [ Case e e .| % .
Scented, 19 oz, 12/Carton Keekrff VoD R G <o
18 30 Each Palmolive Dlshwa;::;zg Liquid, Scented, d Léqr fAcne| & of 0224 |5 3 99 )15 7
Shemosive az
18 20 Each | Triple Action Dish Detergent Orange 52 oz (;f §A47Z g‘ wane| _ 4 78Lo $ . imm :
X BTG5 Al 0
Toilet Seat Cover Dispenser, 17.26 x 3.13 x (—'[-ﬁ;ﬂ %(_{: T 77
C 5 Each 11.76, Smoke Black : 8 A Y109 5545
National Chemical Laboratorles Surge™ g ;
21 10 Case | Heavy-Duty Liquid Draln Opener, 320z, | S-ZMNTZ dZy4G0/2 |4 2 P -
12/C8 VPEN P 4 e e
22 5 Case Bloc Aid Drain Cleaner, 1 Gal, 4/Carton SZvouzz & 2y4Fccy | e 14 2.5y
OrEw
Betco pH7 Dally Floor Cleaner Concentrate, ﬂ FTce I78Y o )
2 &0 SEas Scentad,1 Gal Bottle, 4/Carton S0 : bl VA .00
Mr. Clean Professional All Purpose Floor £ : .
24 20 Each Cleaning Solutton for Finished Floors, IRend - ng‘f 6262/ $ /570 3
2. [ R
1 Gal, Scented MR Cesud
2 20 Case Windex Ammonia-D Glass Cleaner Spray, f { K TR Sy F2707 $ :
Scented, 32 oz, 4/Carton /8 2c 24 o oe
WINDE x
2 20 Each Windex Glass Cleaner with Ammonia-D, \f_ ‘. /e A &9 5D 3 s )
£ Scented, 1 Gal e Va Se 7 55 oy
WiNgx el s
Genuine Joe Aerosol Glass Cleaner, 7;-«, fe=S 2258
a 6 Sose Unscented, 19 0z, 12/Case L : &7 o 260
1
28 200 Box Powder-Free Exam Gloves, 4 Mil, Nitrite, /27,7 LasTres | MF2er nrze s . B
Blue or Black, 100/Per Box {All Sizes) NFZo3, I 205 j '?D 7?0 LOU
e . Each PURELL Advanced Hand Sanitizer S e Sei5oves |
£39 Refreshing Gel, Scented, 1.5 L Zp’ od /OO0 . Ca
Pricing Pages (April 2026) 20f5




4 _
CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES /CITY  Bidder Name: é alen STl 2/5 =7

BID # CR-8695-J6
30 10 Each Sanitizer, Hand,touch free dispenser, /ﬂ 0EL &Yoo / 3
electronic (?80-mil gel soap) /lo AT
/2o
sZee 2 /05 - A =
3 25 Case |Sanitizer, Refill, Hand, Gel (7e8mll), o:érton gl =4 & Ye37°Z | 5% 00 iy —
)
A
Scott Green Certified Foaming Hand Soap ,&mg&q Ciiex 71592
32 75 Case = 4 $ .
efill, Unscented, 1.2 L, 2/Carton 7;_/ e o
-ICOTT . _j:’_jo'o' =13
Softsoap Antlbacterial Liquid Hand Soap, 4, ‘4 ﬂm,w r GSe3stz A
33 5 Each Scented. 11.26 LA 7z LrC . = 3 -
P enoE forrSose J-/E //570 bo
Softsoap Moisturizing Liquid Hand Soap (Lr_aa QAtstiv € {/ ¢3¢ S, .
34 50 Each Refill, Sconted, 128 oz = Jﬁ’ 133 |s 7. 59 & 7/ 50
C.
&
36 80 Each Trash Grabber 36" Length Yser AN G S 2o 42 - ) 5G. 00
i
16 5 Case | Diversey Conq-r-Dust Dust Mop/Dust Cloth 7;,;n Jfe - S 2SSO s
3 Treatment, Scented, 170z Aerosol, 12/Carton 5K ov L YGe o0
37 10 Case Scott Shop Towsls Orlginal, 9" x 12", Blue, /(nga:; v (LML 75/ G $ ) B
200/Box, 8 BoxesiCarton (1,600 Sheets) | =~~~ S5l 425 b
LA b
38 18 Case | SCOtt Shop Towels Original, Blue, 9.4" x 1%, | /7v zey (iney 7550 . i .
55/Roll, 30 Rolls/Carton {1,650 Sheets) forr 70 .co /350 oo
€ = }
38 5 Case Scoft Rags .I.n A Box All-Purpose Towels, 9" | [/, y (’ Y ﬂ.— . | -
X 12", White, 200 Towels/Box Corr /555 F7 e
Pk LG UL L ic. =
40 25 Each Tollet Brush, 15 in., White Besjuniie Fe 3018wk |y A 6 7
41 50 Case Urinal Screens, Scented, §/Box ’r jf’/e -3 L&/ s 3/ 30" 5y 5700
i >
Clorox Disinfecting Wipes Value Pack, o Fe 7
42 80 = Scented, 35 Wipes/Canister, 3/Pack ¥ Y.y 752.00
Clorox Bleach Free Dislnfecting Wipes, | /. . 5563 .
& 1o 20D Scented, 75 Wipes/Canister, 6/Carton ZEER P 590, B0
“ - Caso | Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, Scented, 700 | (),c; B2 h . _
Wipes/Canlster, 2/Carton &7 40 ¢ 7Y W
45 15 Case |3M Scotch-Brite Ze;7psaZLatch Scrub Sponge, | Ja:rc e ,/f;'u—,—t SEZGs S ) eo s
e Ty /a5 e
48 5 Ciise M;. clearI; IProfas::ol:;ll Malglc :r:se;nlfgra /%Jcﬂ;(’ ¢ Candie XL s 5 ) -
ower Disposable Cleaning Pads, 7 Crsan YN 25100
$.0.5. All Surface Scrubber Sponge, Cietex K830 - )
47 5 Case bpps Tl T YA 7 S 2ES Y

Pricing Pages (April 2026)
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BID # CR-8695-J6 CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES /CITY  Bidder Name:
Rubbermaid Commercial HYGEN r-40 — =
48 20 Case | Recycled Microfiber Cloths, 16" x 16", Blue, 4 ﬁf'}/ e =S "j_7‘3£7__ $ o $ =i
24/Pack 2% F580.%°
Professlional Lysol Advanced Deep Clean All-| . —
49 30 Case Purpose Cleaner Spray, Scented, 32 oz, L Ysee d2835Y s 5 7. 60 $
12/Carton Awckif ~ : ,Z/ sl e
Professional Lysol Disinfectant Heavy-Duty | / . {'/ VZ o
50 20 Each FAYTA cf $ $
Bathroom Cleaner, Scented, 1 Gal A 7 /(/, ) j Oﬂz Loy
Lysol Clean & Fresh Multi-Surface Cleaner, / -, N
51 16 Case Sparkling Lamon & Sunflower Essence LAY S 7er 7 $ oo $
Scent, 144 oz, 4/Carton Aek ’ & 3060
Marcal Facial Tissue (Recycled), 2-Ply, A ovd Treevd”
82 s e 100 Tissues/Box, 30 Boxes/Carton : : * 77 A E5F
=2
Bl | o |SemesChuse e e | Sodeglur_Siios s, S o,
vz Packs Jease | Alesver . )
Bounty Eesentlals Select-A-Size Paper .
54 30 Case | Towels, 2-Ply, White, 108 Shests/Roll, 12 LocereerGuse| 17093 s :
Rolis/Carton (1,296 Sheets} e 7y s Z2.20 R
CloroxPro Germicidal Bleach, Concentrated, | /7, . ¢ Feqi b
85 50 Each 1211l oz i s 08¢ $ 393 00
TOTAL - ALL ITEMS GROUP 1 s
Award Based on this amount* 2 &
7_?’: 322,70

GROUP 2 - BIDDER MAY BID ANY OR ALL ITEMS. AWARD TO BE BY LINE ITEM.
See Pages 12-14 of Bid Documents for Specifics on Group 2 ltems
The items provided shall be designed to universally fit all standard paper towel and toilet tissue dispensers

TERTURMANGE SFECIICRTTOW NOTICE

Any manufacturer / brand names or standards identified in this bid are meant to establish a minimum performance standard. Or-equal products
from other manufacturers and/or brands that meet the standards listed are acceptable. The City shall solely make the determination as to

products meeting the minimum performance standard. Vendors are encouraged to inciude product literature with their bid submission to verify

oxocdust somalisoce
ESTI ED
ITEM#| ANNUAL | UNIT DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER PART # UNIT S IOTAL
QUANTITY |
1 a0 | case PAPER TOWELS (DPF) CRYSrptwnes | (MEB SZ /2 |y s
/900 760 o
2 10 CASE TOILET TISSUE (DPF) Aeserers Foo $ $
£3.80 L2 wo
Lgee T
3 100 CASE PAPER TOWELS (DPRC) 55 AT & ooa sy s - s
Y0 B -
4 180 CASE TOILET TISSUE (DPRC, FIRE, IT) Aescer rs Z7¢ $ - s .
S g 7L Co -oE
f Pricing Pages (April 2026) 40f5



Bidder Name: e ’7/’ 2 /"%’ & é—&‘(

BID # CR-8695-J6 CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES / CITY
i
]
1
:
5 450 CASE PAPER TOWELS (FIRE) CRysiALwaes | €W ieorz s : 1
K5O FLho <
e 4 S D
& 50 | CASE PAPER TOWELS (IT) Céekorilpetn | 282y Yopo ao v ¥ _Epepise
Konssay Cae| 25 7c2 ;
z 50 CASE PAPER TOWELS (POLICE) Azvwssz 2 ¢ 3 200" |3 5qop oo
Bosrsivics Lk i 02 B i
8 50 CASE TOILET TISSUE {POLICE) L £f S 23 00 S L spe
Geedsrs gﬁfffc sl
9 30 CASE PAPER TOWELS (DPW) Syszs ¥ g0
CAYE Rpies | MEB 3E 2 B
10 5 CASE PAPER TOWELS (DPW) - ' eo b e
11 5 CASE PAPER TOWELS (DPW) NeRcon! wésog T | LYy
F¥ 35 = 3
2., =
12 3 CASE TOILET TISSUE (DPW ot pivceimac | 425825 g D _
12 (DPW) 5 ¢ Z250.€¢
AEsor o 7E T s
13 5 CASE TOILET TISSUE (DPW) 1 S 22007 |* g 5o
Crawrvi Jo£ 75250 ~Fo .
14 5 CASE TOILET TISSUE (DPW) 13 Z5250 ~F NP LR 1
ANY NON-LISTED ITEMS REQUIRED TO BF
PROCURED FROM THE SELECTED VENDOR MAY BE
PURCHASED BY THE CITY AT A RATE NOT TO
EXCEED 10% OVER THE VENDOR'S NET COST. THE
CITY SHALL CONDUCT RANDOM PRICE AUDITS TO
VERIFY COMPLIANCE WITH THIS PROVISION.
4
!
3
[
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