Petees o
PRICING PAGES — GASOLINE / BID #: CR-8113-W4

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.
= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid

opening.
VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD _
Item | Estimated Description A, B. C. D.
No. Quantity — Freight | Margin Total Total
City of price per Amount
Worcester gallon | (est. quantity
(A.+B) multiplied
byC) |

Furnish and Deliver the following:

Tanker Load Delivery (8.000 gallons or more)

& s [+
1 950,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane 7 UK o0 | Sa { 3 00 |s "1%, Cﬂ
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
Less Than Tanker L.oad Delivery OLD
2 25,000 | Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $:.0%00 | 540500 | 5,/300 | s __5:26 O0—
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR deliver

STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID

PRICE ot
s} b, 7 S0 -
Grand Total

CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:

UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE = 975,000 GALLONS

MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87
OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07 Page 13 of 25
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PRICING PAGES - GASOLINE / BID #: CR-8113-W4
= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.
= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid

opening.
FIXED PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD
Item Estimated Description A. Total Amount
No. Quantity - Fixed (est. quantity
City of price per | multiplied by
Worcester gallon A)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
Tanker L.oad Delivery (8,000 gallons or more) /Uﬂ @ . («5
/
1 950,000 | Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $ 3
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed pricing)
Less Than Tanker 1L.oad Delive
M |8
2 25,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $ Total Item 2
Gallons Per (fixed pricing)
gallon
s
Grand Total

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester
including:
% Cost of Gasoline
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ($ .24)
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Federal Oil Spill Liability Trust Fund ($ .00193 per gallon)
Massachusetts Uniform Qil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Prompt Pay Discount (if applicable)

L)
e oS

*
R4

be

hS

3

5

L2
..

-,

R/
0.0

CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:

UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE = 975,000 GALLONS

MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87
OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07  Page 14 of 25
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= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

PRICING PAGES - DIESEL / BID #: CR-8113-W4

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24 — 12/31/24

40

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. | D.
Ne. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B.) | multiplied
. by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 110,000 | No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified 5080 | .00 | 5.1%60 |5
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
2 (1;23511?,?,2 No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As 5. 30{) $.0500 $,4300 | s
Specified Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE « Q0
SE—%?EQ o
Grand Total

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and invoiced as folows:

* Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in

the Qil Price Daily

Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ( $ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
» State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil - do not include on invoice
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)

Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07
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PRICING PAGES — DIESEL / BID #: CR-8113-W4

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/24 — 12/31/24)

Item Estimated Description A. Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
5 4l e « 00
1 110,000 | No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified $ 3,20 s 355850 —
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)
- e 0
No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As 13 )34 375 o
2 125000 | gpecified Yer Total Item 2
Gallons Gallon (fixed
pricing)
.0
sl&%.avl >3
Grand Total

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.Q.B. destination City of Worcester

including:

¢ Cost of Fuel Qil / Diesel

% Plus Margin
% Plus Freight
< Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel

® State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil - do not include in fixed price

» L)
0.0 L

0.0

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07

Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)
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PRICING PAGES - # 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-8113-W4

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24 — 12/31/24

PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID

PRICE

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon (est. quantity
Waorcester) (A.+B.) | multiplied
[ by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
oD {oo
1 25000 | No. 2 Fuel Oil (Heating Fuel) As Specified se};DD s) o % SM' o
Gallons Per Per Per Per’gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver

$ L)
Grgid Total

The net delivered price (variable r:

ate) to the City will be computed and invoiced as follows:

* Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in

the Oil Price Daily
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ( $ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
» State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include on invoice

Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07
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PRICING PAGES - # 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-8114-W4
OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/24 —12/31/24)

Item Estimated Description A, Total
No. Anpual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)

Furnish and Deliver the following:

0
25,000 | No. 2 Fuel Oil (Heating Oil) sgﬁl s P 000
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)
PO

sgf 000

Grand Total

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester
including:

\J
0.0
7
0.0
L
0.0

L
ot

Cost of Fuel Oil / Diesel
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
* State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil - do not include in fixed price
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)
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= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

PRICING PAGES - DIESEL - WET FUELING / BID #: CR-8113-W4

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24 — 12/31/24

Item Estimated Description A, B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B.) | multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 20,000 No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur or Premium 3.360) slﬂgw $9. 00 $ A -Eg'
Gallens | Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) As Specified Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
______________________________ furnish and
deliver

|

WET FUELING OF EQUIPMENT ON SITE
INCLUDING LOADERS, YARD WASTE
GRINDER AND OTHERS AS NEEDED.

PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and invoiced as follows:

¢ Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in

the Qil Price Daily

Plus Margin

Plus Freight

Plus State Tax ( $ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
> State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include on invoice
¢ Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)

Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per gallon)
¢ Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Scaled Bid Goods & Services)-11-07
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PRICING PAGES - DIESEL - WET FUELING / BID #: CR-8113-W4

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/24 — 12/31/24)

Item

= = m e m e em m E o E A e T e o o e e oEr o oam o o R

WET FUELING OF EQUIPMENT ON SITE
INCLUDING LOADERS, YARD WASTE
GRINDER AND OTHERS AS NEEDED.

[ = A e e e e e e e E o R M R M A v o o o m e e

Estimated Description A. Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
L
1 20,000 | No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur or Premium sﬂ.b‘l $ 9 5 . 4,0)
Gallons | Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) As Specified Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.Q.B. destination City of Worcester

including:

% Cost of Fuel Qil / Diesel

% Plus Margin

% Plus Freight

% Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel

State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include in fixed price
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per galion)

Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

o

L
0.0 L)

>
0.0

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07
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PRICING PAGES — GASOLINE / BID #: CR-8113-W4

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option, The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid
opening.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24~ 12/31/24

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Quantity — Freight | Margin Total Total
City of price per Amount
Worcester gallon | (est. quantity
(A.+B) multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
Tanker Load Delivery (8,000 gallons or more) | .1520 Incl Incl 144,409.08
1 950,000 | Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $ $ b b
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
Less Than Tanker Load Delivery
0.5980 Incl Incl 14,950.24
2 25,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $ $ 5 3
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR deliver
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE §159.359.32
Grand Total

CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:
UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE = 975,000 GALLONS

MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87
OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.

FORM 130B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07 Page 13 of 25



= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid

GGbe ( Ms (o

PRICING PAGES - GASOLINE / BID #: CR-8113-W4

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

opening,

FIXED PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24=712/31/24

Item Estimated Description A. Total Amount
No. Quantity — Fixed (est. quantity
City of price per | multiplied by
Worcester gallon A.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
Tanker Load Delivery (8,000 gallons or more} | NO BID NOBID
1 950,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Qctane $ 5
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed pricing)
Less Than Tanker Load Delivery NO BID NO BID
Y
2 25,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane Y Total Item 2
Gallons Per (fixed pricing)
gallon
§ NOBID
Grand Total

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B, destination City of Worcester

including:

%

*

%

8

e

b

53

o

*
0..

»
Lo

L/
X

*,

3

*

Cost of Gasoline
Plus Margin

Plus Freight

Plus State Tax ($ .24)
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Federal OQil Spill Liability Trust Fund ($ .00193 per gallon)
Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Prompt Pay Discount (if applicable)

UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE =

975,000 GALLONS

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07

CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:

MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87
OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.
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PRICING PAGES - DIESEL / BID #: CR-8113-W4

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24 — 12/31/24

ltem Estimated Description A, B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A, +B) multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
0.1238 incl Incl 13,621.02
1 110,000 No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified $ $ $ b
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
0.1538 | Incl Incl deliver
2 (‘32:““0‘.’1‘: No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As $ $ $ 5222500
Specified Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE 32,846.02
$
Grand Total

will be computed and invoiced as follows:

* Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in
the Qil Price Daily
* Plus Margin
¢  Plus Freight
¢ Plus State Tax ( $.24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
» State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include on invoice
* Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Qil Response and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per gallon)
* Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07  Page 18 of 25
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PRICING PAGES — DIESEL / BID #: CR-8113-W4
OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one vear contract period (1/1/24 — 12/31/24)

Item Estimated Description A, Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)

Furnish and Deliver the following:

NO BID NO BID
1 110,000 No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified 3 b3
Gallons Per Total ltem 1
gallon (fixed
pricin
NO BID NO B?E)
No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As L3 3
2 125,000 Specified Per Total Item 2
Gallons Gallon (fixed
pricing)
$ NO BID

Grand Total

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester
including:
% Cost of Fuel Oil / Diesel
% Plus Margin
< Plus Freight
¢ Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
» State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include in fixed price
% Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) (3.0010 per gallon)
%* Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee (3 .00119 per gallon)
% Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07 Page 19 of 25
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PRICING PAGES — # 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-8113-W4

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24 — 12/31/24

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B) | multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following;:
NO BIID NO BID
1 15,000 No. 2 Fuel Oil (Heating Fuel) As Specified $ $ $ $
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
NO BID
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR $
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID Grand Total
PRICE

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and invoiced as follows:

¢ Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in
the Oil Price Daily
¢ Plus Margin
®  Plus Freight
* Plus State Tax ( § .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
> State Tax does not apply te No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include on invoice
¢ Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
* Plus Massachusetts Uniform Qil Response and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per gallon)
¢ Less Cash Discount (if applicable)
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PRICING PAGES —# 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-8114-W4
OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/24 — 12/31/24)

Item Estimated Description A. Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)

NOBID NO BID
25,000 No. 2 Fuel Oil (Heating Oil) b3 S
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)
g NOBID
Grand Total

Furnish and Deliver the following:

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester
including:

e
o
o
o

(J
L
L)
Lol
*

..0

Cost of Fuel Qil / Diesel
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
® State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include in fixed price
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)
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PRICING PAGES - DIESEL — WET FUELING / BID #: CR-8113-W4

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24 — 12/31/24

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
{City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A. +B.) | multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
NO BID NO BID
1 20,000 No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur or Premium 3 $ 3 $
Gallons Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) As Specified Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
WET FUELING OF EQUIPMENT ON SITE deliver

INCLUDING LOADERS, YARD WASTE
GRINDER AND OTHERS AS NEEDED.

PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and inveiced as follows:

¢ Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in
the Oil Price Daily
* Plus Margin
Plus Freight
¢ Plus State Tax ( $ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
» State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include on invoice
¢ Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
¢ Plus Massachusetts Uniform Qil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
¢ Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Scaled Bid Goods & Services)-11-07  Page 24 of 25
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PRICING PAGES - DIESEL — WET FUELING / BID #: CR-8113-W4
OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/24 — 12/31/24)

Item Estimated Description A. Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)

NO BID NO BID
20,000 No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur or Premium b $
Gallons Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) As Specified Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)

Furnish and Deliver the following:

WET FUELING OF EQUIPMENT ON SITE
INCLUDING LOADERS, YARD WASTE
GRINDER AND OTHERS AS NEEDED.

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.0Q.B. destination City of Worcester
including:

NG
e

*,
...

\/
0
&

R

3

%

X3

%

*

L
.0

Cost of Fuel Oil / Diesel
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
»  State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include in fixed price
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) (5$.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Qil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)
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PRICING PAGES — GASOLINE / BID #: CR-8113-W4

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option,
= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid

opening.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24— 12/31/24

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Quantity - Freight | Margin Total Total
City of price per Amount
Worcester gallon (est. quantity
(A.+B.) multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
Tanker Load Delivery (8,000 gallons or more) \
1 950,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $ \ 3 b /

Gallons Per r Per /Per gallon
gallon gall gallon cost to

furnish and

deliver
Less Than Tanker Load Delivery
2 25,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Qctane $ 3 /|5 $
Gallons Per P Per N\ Per gallon
gallon lon gallon cost to
ish and
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR déliver
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE A
$
/ Grand Total

CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:

UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE 975,000 GALLONS

MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87
OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.

FORM 30B (Scaled Bid Goods & Services)-11-07 Page 13 of 25
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PRICING PAGES - GASOLINE / BID #: CR-8113-W4

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid
opening.

FIXED PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24 — 12/31/24

Item Estimated Description A. Total Amount
No. Quantity - Fixed (est. quantity
City of price per | multiplied by

Worcester gallon A)

Furnish and Deliver the following:

Tanker Load Delivery (8,000 gallons or more}

1 950,000 | Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $
Gallons Per

Less Than Tanker Load Delivery

2 25,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $

Gallons er (fixed pricing)

b

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.Q.B. destination City of Worcester
including:
%+ Cost of Gasoline
% Plus Margin
< Plus Freight
< Plus State Tax ($ .24)
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Federal Oil Spill Liability Trust Fund ($ .00193 per gallon)
Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)

Prompt Pay Discount (if applicable)

() » . L
0.0 ... ..O ..0

CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:

UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE ) 975,000 GALLONS

MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87
OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07  Page 14 of 25



= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

B

PRICING PAGES - DIESEL / BID #: CR-8113-W4

s O:f

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24 — 12/31/24

Item Estimated Description A, B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B.) | multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 110,000 No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified S .&0 5. I3 $ :33 $ 300
Gallons Per Per Per Pergallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
2 gaslig?lo No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As $ RO $.! 9 I o | $ Y SCD
s Specified Per Per Per Per gallon
gallen gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver

PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and invoiced as follows:

¢ Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in
the Oil Price Daily
Plus Margin
e Plus Freight
e Plus State Tax ( $ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
» State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include on invoice
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
e Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07
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PRICING PAGES - DIESEL / BID #: CR-8113-W4

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/24 — 12/31/24)

Item Estimated Description A, Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Qua-antity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 110,000 | No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified s3.1586 $3£ﬂ; YUt
Gallons Per Total tem 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)
No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As $315 6‘!56 $ LD\LI ‘w
2 125,000 | gpecified Per | Total ldem 2
Gallons Gallon (fixed
pricing)
5140,5580,60
Grand Total

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester
including:

L7
-t
L2
...
L)
o

L)
o

(/)
ot

» L7
0.. O‘.

Cost of Fuel Oil / Diesel
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
» State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include in fixed price
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) (8.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07  Page 19 of 25



8(’0 o o tk {
PRICING PAGES - # 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-8113-W4

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24 — 12/31/24

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B) { multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 25,000 | No. 2 Fuel Oil (Heating Fuel) As Specified ss b0 |50 |59 |s \ 1,000
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR $171,6¢0
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID Grand Total
PRICE

The net delivered price (variable rate} to the City will be computed and inveiced as follows:

¢ Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in
the Oil Price Daily
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
¢ Plus State Tax ( $ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
» State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include on invoice
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07  Page 22 of 25




Bm) co O, (
PRICING PAGES —# 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-8114-W4

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/24 — 12/31/24)

Item Estimated Description A. Total
No. Annual Fixed Ameount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 25,000 No. 2 Fuel Oil (Heating Oil) h 3 3‘ ,“ b ] 5;,7”
Gallons Per Total Mtem 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)

sgﬂcj 150
Grand“Total

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester

including:

+ Cost of Fuel Oil / Diesel
+ Plus Margin

%+ Plus Freight

+* Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel

State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include in fixed price

Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) (3.0010 per gallon)

Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

», *, LA
0.0 ‘.’ ..0

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07
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= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

g (eo O | (
PRICING PAGES - DIESEL - WET FUELING / BID #: CR-8113-W4

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24 — 12/31/24

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon (est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B.) | multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 20,000 No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur or Premium $ §\ $ S/
Gallons | Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) As Specified Per Per |/ Per gallon
gallon galio gallon cost to
furnish and
WET FUELING OF EQUIPMENT ON SITE deliver

INCLUDING LOADERS, YARD WASTE
GRINDER AND OTHERS AS NEEDED.

PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE

-

/

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be co

mputed and invoiced as follows:

e Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in
the Oil Price Daily

Plus Margin
Plus Freight
e Plus State Tax ( $ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
> State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil ~ do not include on invoice
¢ Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
e Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07
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PRICING PAGES - DIESEL — WET FUELING / BID #: CR-8113-W4

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/24 — 12/31/24)

Item Estimated Description A. Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester} by A.)

20,000 No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur or Premium 5

Gallons Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) As Specified ;/
gallo

Furnish and Deliver the following:

\

INCLUDING LOADERS, YARD WASTE
GRINDER AND OTHERS AS NEEDED,

WET FUELING OF EQUIPMENT ON SITE I\/

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester
including:

ol

.. L)

%

53

b

L/
e

>
5

e
0‘0

Cost of Fuel Qil / Diesel
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
= State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil - do not include in fixed price
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)
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PRICING PAGES - GASOLINE / BID #: CR-8113-W4

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.
= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid

opening.
VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD —
Item Estimated Description A, B. C. D,
No. Quantity — Freight | Margin Total Total
City of price per Amount
Worcester gallon | (est. quantity
(A.+B.) multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
Tanker Load Delivery (8,000 gallons or more) ,
0973 | 9T T, 40 .
1 950,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane S O $ b $
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
Less Than Tanker Load Delivery .
3Gy | 19575
2 | 25000 | Unleaded Regular —Minimum 87.0 Octane s O s $ s [/ 80.
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR deliver
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE
s 700
Grand Total

CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:
UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE = 975,000 GALILONS

MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY, ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87
OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.

CONTRACT VENDOR

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07  Page 13 0f 25



8()(" e
PRICING PAGES - GASOLINE / BID #: CR-8113-W4

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.
= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid

opening.
FIXED PRICING ~ /2 MONTH PERIOD
Item Estimated Description A. Total Amount
No. Quantity — Fixed (est. quantity
City of price per | multiplied by
Waorcester gallon A.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
Tanker Load Delivery (8,000 gallons or more)
1 | 950,000 | Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane s 67| s ): 5550
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon {fixed pricing)
Less Than Tanker Load Delivery
s/ Mo
2 25,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $ & ’ a f Total'ltem 2
Gallons Per (fixed pricing)
gallon
s& 4 &'7 7So
rand Total

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester
including:
< Cost of Gasoline
% Plus Margin
< Plus Freight
** Plus State Tax (§ .24)
% Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) (3.0010 per gallon)
% Federal Oil Spill Liability Trust Fund ($ .00193 per gallon)
%+ Massachusetts Uniform OQil Response and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per gallon)
“ Prompt Pay Discount (if applicable)

S ——— -
CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:

UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE = 975,000 GALLONS

MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87
OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.

FORM 30B (Scaled Bid Goods & Services)-11-07  Pape 14 of 25
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PRICING PAGES - DIESEL / BID #: CR-8113-W4

< Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24 — 12/31/24

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B.) | multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
O | 14| /19 /35 $EL
1 110,000 | No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified $ s $ $
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
ETON ) O '////&\ '//4/0L /?5 25
2 Gal;ons No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As $ $ $ $
Specified Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID } é
PRICE 2 %> 7
s -~ 7
Grand Total

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and invoiced as follows:

* Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in

the Oil Price Daily
e Plus Margin
¢  Plus Freight
¢ Plus State Tax ( §.24 per gallon) for diesel fuel

> State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil ~ do not include on invoice

* Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) (3.0010 per gallon)
* Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07

Page 1§ of 25
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PRICING PAGES - DIESEL / BID #: CR-8113-W4

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/24 — 12/31/24)

item Estimated Description A, Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)
Furaish and Deliver the following:
3. 668 >y J /5%
1 110,000 No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified b s 7
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed
> pricing)
Na, 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As s '06‘{ ‘-S?fjf / 9;5\
2 125000 | gponified Per Total Item 2
Gallons Gallon (fixed
pricing)
2do, 375
s 7 _
Grand Total

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gatlon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester
including:

>
L)

.
3
>

»
"

>
L

L)
o

*

0‘0

Cost of Fuel Oil/ Diesel
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
* State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil - do not include in fixed price
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) (5.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07  Page 19 of 25



PRICING PAGES - # 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-8113-W4

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

8%15“—

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24 — 12/31/24
Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B) | multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Detiver the following:
Ao | A | A
&) st/ |58/ |52
1 25,000 No. 2 Fuel Oil (Heating Fuel) As Specified $ £ Sﬁ 10/ SAO ; $5 ¢
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
Ao
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR s. B
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID Grand Total

PRICE

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and invoiced as follows:

¢ Boston low reseller rack
the Qil Price Daily
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ( $.24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
> State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil - do not include on invoice

* Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
. 00119 per gallon)

Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee (3

* Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07

posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in
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Porke

PRICING PAGES - # 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-8114-W4

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/24 — 12/31/24)

Item Estimated Description Al Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 25,000 No. 2 Fuel Oil (Heating Oil) S $
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)

$
Grand Total

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate

including:

% Cost of Fuel Oil / Diesel

<+ Plus Margin

» Plus Freight

« Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel

2 Fuel Oil - do not include in fixed price

* State Tax does not apply to No.

*%* Plus Federal Leaking Underground S
% Plus Massachusetts Uniform Qil Res

%+ Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07

per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester

torage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per galion)
ponse and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per galion)
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= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

Bo e

PRICING PAGES - DIESEL - WET FUELING / BID #: CR-81 13-w4

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/24 — 12/31/24
——= e AN 1 MONIA FERIOD 1/1/24 — 12/31/24

Ftem Estimated Description A, B. C. D.
No. Ammual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B.) | multiplicd
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 20,000 No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur or Premium 3 3 $ )
Gallons Ulira Low Sulfur Diesel) As Specified Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
----------------------------- deliver

e m M e m e S E N EE e EE e EEE e e o e e om a

PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and invoiced as follows:

Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in
the Oil Price Daily
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ( $.24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
> State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil - do not include on invoice
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) (5.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 308 (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07 Page 24 of 25
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PRICING PAGES - DIESEL - WET FUELING / BID #: CR-8113-W4

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/24 - 12/31/24)

Item Estimated Description A, Total
No, Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)

20,000 No. 2 Dlesel (Ultra Low Sulfur or Premium $ $
Gallons | Ultra Low Sulfur Diescl) As Specified Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)

Furnish and Deliver the following:

[T e e m o E e e . e E e E. e m. - -

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester
including:

N
L

-
.’0

L)
“ne

L/
o

L)
e

"/
L4

L)
b

Cost of Fuel Oil / Diesel
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax (3 .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
" State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include in Jixed price
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) (8.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)
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