PRICING PAGES — GASOLINE / BID #: CR-7730-W2

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid
opening.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/22°=12/31/22

Item Estimated Description A, B. C. D.
No, Quantity - Freight | Margin Total Total
City of price per Amount
Worcester gallon | (est. quantity
{A.+B.) multiplied
g by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
Tanker Load Delivery (8,000 gallons or more) do
1 450,000 | Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane s»ﬂ' 3 :/ D $ ¢ / DKJ $A/5000
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
Less Than Tanker Load Delivery '
1’/0 yy ‘ .'?.5-}’
2 25,000 | Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $ "@/ $! 507 (2 s/ D'lé 00
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR deliver
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID Al ot
PRICE ig a0
Grand Total

CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:

UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE = 475,000 GALLONS

MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87
OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.

PCT“CdM
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PRICING PAGES — GASOLINE / BID #: CR-7730-W2

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid
opening.

FIXED PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/22 — 12/31/22

Item Estimated Description A. Total Amount
No. Quantity — Fixed (est. quantity
City of price per | multiplied by
Worcester gallen A)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
Tanker Load Delivery (8,000 gallons or more)
1 450,000 { Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane s’ﬂm M_A
Gallons ~ Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed pricing)
Less Than Tanker Load Delivery ' . t
SJ ll ” l: l!. El»
2 25,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum §7.0 Octane 5 otal Item 2
Gallons er (fixed pricing)
gallon

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester

including:

% Cost of Gasoline
Plus Margin

Plus Freight

Plus State Tax ($ .24)
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Federal Qil Spill Liability Trust Fund ($ .00193 per gallon)
Massachusetts Uniform Qil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Prompt Pay Discount (if applicable)

* > *
e 4 e

%

*

e

%

2

*

.
...

UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE =

475,000 GALLONS

p‘-TCrb S.VaN

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07

CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:

MID-GRADE (8% OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87
OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.
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= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

PRICING PAGES — DIESEL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/22 — 12/31/22

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D,
No. Annual Freight | Margin Tatal Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B.) | multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
c,/ L 28—
I 75,000 No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified Sﬂ $ '/ $ 8/ $ / U{m
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
) deliver
af
2 :‘,‘3;3;2?;2 No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As sj i 5 (Qg $ 'olg $%Q"'
Specified Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR .
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE HL] M : !

NG

Grand Total

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and invoiced as follows:

e Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in

the Qil Price Daily

Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ( $ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
» State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include on invoice
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)

Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee (3 .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07
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PRICING PAGES - DIESEL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one vear contract period (1/1/22 — 12/31/22)

Item Estimated Description A. Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Qufmtity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.) O
Furnish and Deliver the following: 5
¢
la°°“ qéo’(ﬂ
I 75,000 No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified QJ\ $]
Gallons Per Total Item 1 /O
gallon (fixed 5
/]CIK—" pricing) 4 ‘
A1 2700
No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As $ 3 3
2 gsﬁooo Specified Per Total Item 2
allons Gallon (fixed
pricing) OO
13
Grand Total

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.Q.B. destination City of Worcester

including:

% Cost of Fuel Qil / Diesel

% Plus Margin
% Plus Freight
¢ Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel

X3

8

53

*

-
°o

pc-ﬁ(r):q

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07

State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include in fixed price
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)
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PRICING PAGES -#2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/22 — 12/31/22

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
{City of gallen {est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B) multiplied
_ ) by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
) § ol . 160
i (Heat : A i s’ 15 TR0~
1 35,000 No. 2 Fuel Oil (Heating Fuel) As Specified $ $ ¢ $ a
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
- i 429"
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR $_| ‘g /7 5[2
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID Grand Total
PRICE

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and invoiced as follows:

¢ Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in
the Qil Price Daily
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ( $ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
» State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Qil — do not include on invoice
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)

Less Cash Discount (if applicable)
pi Teeda M
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PRICING PAGES - # 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/22 — 12/31/22)

Item Estimated Description A. Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)
Furnish and Deliver the following;:
1 35,000 No. 2 Fuel Qil (Heating Oil) qul $ C}gcmﬁ
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)
4599
Grand Total

00

00

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester

including:

<+ Cost of Fuel Qil / Diesel

..

*

., -
" e

* Plus Margin

Plus Freight

Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel

State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Qil — do not include in fixed price

% Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
% Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
¢ Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07
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PRICING PAGES — GASOLINE / BID #: CR-7730-W2

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.
= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid

opening.
VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD _
Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Quantity — Freight | Margin Total Total
City of price per Amount
Worcester gallon | (est. quantity
(A.+B) multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
Tanker Load Delivery (8,000 gallons or mere)
Tamkerlond o4 | oyl | | 987000
1 450,000 | Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $a. 0o 5 b} $
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
Less Than Tanker Load Deliver
Gioo | 3] 1114} Y55, ac
2 25,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $ $ 3
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR deliver
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE as_} 75/ 4
Grand Total

CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:

UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE = 475,000 GALLONS

MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87
OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.

3} wrlee
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= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.
= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid

opening.

FIXED PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD —

PRICING PAGES — GASOLINE / BID #: CR-7730-W2

Item Estimated Description A, Total Amount
No. Quantity - Fixed (est. quantity
City of price per | multiplied by
Worcester _gallon Al
Furnish and Deliver the following:
Tanker Load Delivery (8.000 gallons or more)
Y. JorH / [ 3‘3770,(70
1 450,000 | Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane 3 $
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed pricing)
Less Than Tanker Load Delivery 5 é }5 53: Q]
Q}A 5
’ I
2 25,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane % Total Item 2
Gallons Per (fixed pricing)
gallon |// W
$ 5/ SQJ'
Grand Total

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.Q.B. destination City of Worcester
including:

Cost of Gasoline

Plus Margin

Plus Freight

Plus State Tax ($ .24)

Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)

Federal Oil Spill Liability Trust Fund ($ .00193 per gallon)

Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per gallon)

Prompt Pay Discount (if applicable)

L) », 7 L) L) -, L/ e
0.0 0.0 0.0 b X X 0.0 ‘.0

?

CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:

UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE

475,000 GALLONS

MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87
OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.

BQIEQ

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07  Page 14 of 24



PRICING PAGES - DIESEL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/22 — 12/31/22

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gatlon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B.) | multiplied
. by C)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
0,00 |9} 4} |B56S 00
1 75,000 Ne. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified $ $ $ $
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon galion cost to
furnish and
deliver
135,000 : : 000 | M4\ /1| 1S41).04
2 Galions No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As $ b $ $
Specified Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallen gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE > 9599ed
$
Grand Total

L

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and invoiced as follows:

* Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in

the Oil Price Daily

Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ( $ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
» State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include on invoice
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) (3.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
¢ Less Cash Discount (if applicabie)

Borke

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07
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PRICING PAGES ~ DIESEL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one vear contract period (1/1/22 — 12/31/22)

Item Estimated Description A. Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
5831 74//5, 45
1 75,000 | No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified $ $ !
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)
No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As aﬁz’ 538 53 Yo450p, do
2 135000 | ghecified Per | Totalltem 2
Gallons Gallon (fixed
pricing)
59359, do
L
Grand Toetal

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester
including:

N7
0.0

) L )
0.0 o e

Cost of Fuel Qil / Diesel
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
= State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include in fixed price
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

qué‘ﬁ
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PRICING PAGES - # 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/22 — 12/31/22

Item Estimated Description A, B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Waorcester) (A.+B.) | multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
e ) B
]
1 35,000 No. 2 Fuel Oil (Heating Fuel) As Specified $ S J S/ 5 / $/
Gallons Per Per ” Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR $
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID Grand Total

PRICE

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and invoiced as follows:

* Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in

the Oil Price Daily
¢ Plus Margin
Plus Freight

¢  Plus State Tax ( $ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel

Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
* Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

> State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include on inveice

o k<

FORM 308 (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07
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PRICING PAGES - # 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/22 —12/31/22)

Item Estimated Description A. Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)

Furnish and Deliver the following:

1 35,000 No. 2 Fuel Oil (Heating Oil) 5 b}
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)
$

Grand Total

= Fixed price per gallon shalil be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester
including:

Cost of Fuel Qil / Diesel

Plus Margin

Plus Freight

Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
* State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include in fixed price

Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)

Plus Massachusetts Uniform OQil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)

Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

-, (/
0.0 0.0

L/
e

L)
Nt

> L7
0.’ '..

3

%
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PRICING PAGES — GASOLINE / BID #: CR-7730-W2

< Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.
= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid

opening.
VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD _
Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Quantity — Freight | Margin Total Total
City of price per Amount
Worcester gallon | (est. quantity
(A.+B.) multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
Tanker Load Delivery (8.000 galions or more)
1 450,000 | Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane .42 $ 0oL $0- ”f $ L3 00O
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
Less Than Tanker Load Delivery
2 25,000 | Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $0.12 |$0.02 |50.14 |s 3 )S‘a&
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR deliver
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE
$ gﬁ s
Grand Total

CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:

UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE = 475,000 GALLONS

MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE RE QUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87
OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED,
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.

S_;/)‘h Bdck ‘-)/
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PRICING PAGES — GASOLINE / BID #: CR-7730-W2

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.
= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid

opening.
FIXED PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD
Item Estimated Description A, Total Amount
No. Quantity - Fixed (est. quantity
City of price per | multiplied by
Worcester gallon A) |
Furnish and Deliver the following:
Tanker Load Delivery (8.000 gallons or more) j -
Z.52%0 i, 135" oo
1 450,000 | Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane 3 $
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed pricing)
Less Than Tanker Load Delivery ’8" 3 oo~
2.5 | §
2 25,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane 5 Total Item 2
Gallons Per (fixed pricing)
allon -
& $ ‘i ??4 Qoo
Grand Total
|

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester
including:
% Cost of Gasoline
% Plus Margin
% Plus Freight
< Plus State Tax (§ .24)
% Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
< Federal Oil Spill Liability Trust Fund ($ .00193 per gallon)
<+ Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
< Prompt Pay Discount (if applicable)

CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:

UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE . 475,000 GALLONS
MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87

OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.

«San T< BJcé C//
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= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

PRICING PAGES - DIESEL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/22 - 12/31/22

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B.) | multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 75,000 | No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified $ ,% sm/ﬁ s%fé $ %[A
Gallons er Per er Pet gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
2 gsﬁg?:: No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As $ :"l"'j‘l $ :'ll'/‘f $ gﬂ A 3 /:4
Specified Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver

PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID

PRICE

A

$ A/
Grand Total

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and invoiced as follows:

¢ Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in

the Oil Price Daily

Plus Margin
Plus Freight
¢ Plus State Tax ( $ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
» State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include on invoice
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

50/177' Bacl:(cy

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07
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PRICING PAGES - DIESEL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/22 — 12/31/22)

Item Estimated Description A. Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 75,000 No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified $ a”l"'/.{ﬂ $ ,fi"'/‘q
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gatlon (fixed
pricing)
No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As b {‘.;.-"";A 3 %i/ A
2 135,000 Specified er Total Item 2
Gallons Gallon (fixed
pricing)
$
Grand Total
= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester

including:
% Cost of Fuel Qil / Diesel
% Plus Margin
% Plus Freight
< Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
* State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include in fixed price
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

L)
"

>

o
%

*,
0.0
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PRICING PAGES - # 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option,

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/22 - 12/31/22

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B.) multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 35,000 No. 2 Fuel Oil (Heating Fuel) As Specified $ ,{'i’!gé $ {VA’I $ ﬂ'/‘ﬁ $ ﬂ'/q
Gallons Pbr Per Per Pef gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR s N 4

STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID

PRICE

Grdnd Total

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the Ci

will be computed and invoiced as follows:

* Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in

the Oil Price Daily
¢ Plus Margin
Plus Freight

Plus State Tax ( $ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel

Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee (3 .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)

» State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil - do not include on invoice

)’ a7 R el <y

FORM 30B (Secaled Bid Goods & Services)-11-07
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PRICING PAGES - # 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-7730-W2
OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/22 — 12/31/22)

Item Estimated Description A, Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)

35000 | No. 2 Fuel Oil (Heating Oil) $ N/d $ NAI
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)
s
Grand Total

Furnish and Deliver the following:

= Fixed price per galion shall be a flat rate per gallon F.Q.B. destination City of Worcester
including:

e
o
L/
"
L)
0.0

*
0.0

Cost of Fuel Oil / Diesel
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
= State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include in fixed price
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)
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PRICING PAGES — GASOLINE / BID #: CR-7730-W2

< Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.
= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid

opening.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/22 = 12/31/22

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Quantity - Freight | Margin Total Total
City of price per Amount
Worcester gallon | (est. quantity
(A. +B) multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
Tanker Load Delivery (8,000 gallons or more)
1 450,000 | Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $ncluded| $0.0897 | $_0.0897 | $ 40,365
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
Less Than Tanker Load Delivery
2 25,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $included| $ 021291 $0.2129 | $ 5,322.50
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR deliver
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE
$ 45,687.50
Grand Total

CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:

UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE =

FORM 30B (Sealed Bid Goods & Services)-11-07

475,000 GALLONS

MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87
OCTANE) SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.
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PRICING PAGES — GASOLINE / BID #: CR-7730-W2

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

= Award will be made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for either the variable or
fixed price option. The City of Worcester will make this determination within 4 hours of bid
opening.

FIXED PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/22 - 12/31/22

Item Estimated Description A, Total Amount
No. Quantity - Fixed {est. quantity
City of price per | multiplied by

Worcester __gallon A)

Furnish and Deliver the following:

Tanker Load Delivery (8,000 gallons or more)

1 450,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $NOBID| §__ NOBID
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed pricing)

Less Than Tanker Load Delivery

$ NO BID
2 25,000 Unleaded Regular — Minimum 87.0 Octane $NO BID Total Item 2
Gallons Per {fixed pricing)
gallon
$ NO BID
Grand Total

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.Q.B. destination City of Worcester
including:
% Cost of Gasoline
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax (§ .24)
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Federal Qil Spill Liability Trust Fund ($ .00193 per gallon)
Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Prompt Pay Discount (if applicable)
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CITY OF WORCESTER ESTIMATED CONSUMPTION FOR A 12-MONTH PERIOD:
UNLEADED REGULAR 87.0 OCTANE = 475,000 GALLONS
MID-GRADE (89 OCTANE) AND PREMIUM GRADE (93 OCTANE) GASOLINE MAY BE REQUESTED
UNDER THIS CONTRACT BY THE CITY. ALL PRICING FOR GRADES OTHER THAN REGULAR (87

OCTANE)} SHALL BE PAID FOR AT THE SAME MARGIN / FREIGHT RATES IF REQUESTED.
CONTRACT VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE PRICE QUOTES FOR 89 OR 93 OCTANE AS NEEDED.
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PRICING PAGES - DIESEL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/22 — 12/31/22

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No., Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester) (A.+B.) | multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 75,000 No. 2 Diesel (Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified $Included $0.1059 | $0.1059 | $_7,942.50
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cast to
furnish and
deliver
2 135,000 1 No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As | Sincluded $,0.0966 | $.0.0966 | $_13.041
Gallons .
Specified Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon galion cost to
furnish and
deliver
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID
PRICE
$_20.983.50
Grand Total

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and invoiced as follows:

* Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in
the Qil Price Daily
*  Plus Margin
¢ Plus Freight
¢  Plus State Tax ( §.24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
» State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include on invoice
¢ Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) (5.0010 per gallon)
¢ Plus Massachusetts Uniform Qil Response and Prevention Fee (3 .00119 per gallon)

¢ Less Cash Discount (if applicable)
(lobe ¢ Mente( fo
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PRICING PAGES - DIESEL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/22 — 12/31/22)

Item Estimated Description A. Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | {est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 75,000 No. 2 Diesel {Ultra Low Sulfur) As Specified $NOBID| $ NO BID
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)
No. 2 Diesel (Premium Ultra Low Sulfur) As $ NOBID| § NO BID
2 135,000 | gpecified Per | Total Item 2
LI Gallon (fixed
pricing)
$ NOBID
Grand Total

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester
including:
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Cost of Fuel Qil / Diesel
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax ($ .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
® State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include in fixed price
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per galion)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)
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PRICING PAGES - # 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

= Bidders may bid the variable price option and/or the fixed price option.

VARIABLE PRICING ~ 12 MONTH PERIOD 1/1/22 — 12/31/22

Item Estimated Description A. B. C. D.
No. Annual Freight | Margin Total Total
Quantity price per Amount
(City of gallon | (est. quantity
Worcester} (A.+B.) | multiplied
by C.)
Furnish and Deliver the following:
1 35,000 No. 2 Fuel Oil (Heating Fuel) As Specified $NO BID $SNOBID $NOBID | SNOBID
Gallons Per Per Per Per gallon
gallon gallon gallon cost to
furnish and
deliver
PLEASE DO NOT INCLUDE FEDERAL OR $ NOBID
STATE TAXES IN THE VARIABLE BID Grand Total
PRICE

The net delivered price (variable rate) to the City will be computed and invojced as follows:

* Boston low reseller rack posting for selected grade of diesel in effect on date of delivery as posted in
the Oil Price Daily
¢ Plus Margin
e Plus Freight
e Plus State Tax ( $.24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
> State Tax does not apply fo No. 2 Fuel Oil - do not include on invoice
* Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) ($.0010 per gallon)
* Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($.00119 per gallon)

® Less Cash Discount (if applicable)
(e ( ontlo
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PRICING PAGES —# 2 FUEL OIL / BID #: CR-7730-W2

OPTIONAL FIXED PRICING (for one year contract period (1/1/22 — 12/31/22)

ltem Estimated Description A. Total
No. Annual Fixed Amount
Quantity price per | (est. quantity
(City of gallon multiplied
Worcester) by A.)

35,000 No. 2 Fuel Qil {(Heating Qil) $NOBID| $_NQBID
Gallons Per Total Item 1
gallon (fixed
pricing)
$_NOBID
Grand Total

Furnish and Deliver the following:

= Fixed price per gallon shall be a flat rate per gallon F.O.B. destination City of Worcester
including:
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Cost of Fuel Oil / Diesel
Plus Margin
Plus Freight
Plus State Tax (3 .24 per gallon) for diesel fuel
* State Tax does not apply to No. 2 Fuel Oil — do not include in fixed price
Plus Federal Leaking Underground Storage Tank (LUST) (5.0010 per gallon)
Plus Massachusetts Uniform Oil Response and Prevention Fee ($ .00119 per gallon)
Less Cash Discount (if applicable)
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