BIDDER GROUP 1 GROUP 2A | GROUP 2B GROUP 3 GROUP 4 GROUP 5 GROUP 6 GROUP 7A GROUP 7B GROUP 7C GROUP 7E GROUP 8
The Jack Farrelly Co. $66,991.61* | $ 26,324.20 no bid no bid $ 562,641.93 no bid $ 66,607.00 [ $ 12,078.06 [ $ 11,956.68 | $  5,900.00
Ti-SALES, Inc. $ 67,835.25 | $§ 29,254.97 no bid $ 105,356.85 no bid no bid $ 83,940.00 no bid no bid no bid
Auburn WinWater Works no bid no bid no bid no bid $ 524,402.60 27,71820 | $ 66,576.30 | $ 12,445.66 no bid no bid
Stiles Co. $ 65,972.01 | $ 26,055.94 $21,114.60] $ 91,872.85 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Dana Kepner dba Putnam

Pipe $ 66,840.57 | $ 26,208.88 $22,741.12| $ 98,367.15 | $ 536,245.92 27,225.00 | $ 63,505.00 | $ 11,960.00 [ $ 12,141.00 | $  7,000.00
Ferguson Waterworks $ 68,009.55 | $ 21,869.14 $21,976.76] $§ 93,185.20 | $ 537,252.80 27,570.60 | $§ 66,821.98 | $ 12,039.96 | $ 11,970.98 | $ 4,900.00
Core & Main $ 86,822.40 | $ 24,116.71 $21,998.94| $ 178,092.15 [ $ 518,352.13 29,261.40 | $ 62,758.94 | $ 11,554.00 [ $ 12,97515 | $  9,800.00
H.R. Prescott & Sons no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 27,776.00 | $§ 65,388.40 | $ 12,720.00 | $ 12,039.80 | $ 5,060.00
E.J. Prescott $ 70,826.68 | $ 25,082.14 $21,051.08| $ 91,967.40 no bid 3292120 [ § 64,683.95| $ 9,000.00 | $ 1145473 | $  4,700.00

*total price with 2% prompt
pay discount = $ 65,651.78
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