BIDDER GROUP 1 GROUP 2 GROUP 3 GROUP 4 GROUP 5 GROUP 6 GROUP 7A GROUP 7B GROUP 7C GROUP 7E GROUP 8
The Jack Farrelly Co. $ 60,609.53 | $ 19,286.32 no bid no bid $ 4852050 | $ 41,114.00 [ $ 24,397.00 | $ 63,278.20 | § 18,788.64 | $ 12,469.26 no bid
Ti-SALES, Inc. $ 60,189.04 | $ 23,556.19 77,820.75 no bid no bid no bid no bid $ 96,473.37 no bid no bid no bid
Auburn WinWater Works no bid no bid 84,378.15 | $ 518,279.65 no bid no bid no bid $ 63,343.95 | $ 18,808.00 no bid no bid
Stiles Co. $ 58,488.46 | $ 19,538.69 78,968.35 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Putnam Pipe $ 60,044.22 | § 24,982.24 no bid $ 510,184.25 | $§ 41,980.00 | $§ 39,970.00 | $ 27,301.00 | $ 63,167.00 | $ 18,296.00 | $ 11,967.66 | $  7,200.00
Ferguson $ 61,957.83 | $ 20,002.52 102,864.62 | $ 526,425.88 | $ 46,107.50 [ § 42,970.00 | § 29,238.80 | $ 64,637.87 [ $ 18,788.64 | $ 13,224.54 [ §  5,954.00
FW Webb $ 87,627.39 no bid no bid $ 551,426.79 no bid no bid $ 29968.80 | $ 64,707.26 | $ 19,853.34 | § 14,562.48 no bid
H.R. Prescott & Sons no bid no bid no bid no bid $ 5477250 | $ 42,520.00 [ § 25,235.20 | $ 63,329.00 | § 19,850.00 | $ 12,390.00 [ $§  8,000.00
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