PRICING/SPECIFICATION PAGE — Athletic Equipment - Fall / WPS
Bid #: 8473-J6

The Worcester Public Schools are looking to purchase athletic equipment. The vendor shall provide pricing on

the following products. ’;B S N Se s ERS LL C/

Award to be made PER LINE ITEM. Bidder should ONLY bid items they can supply.
Bid shall include all associated fees, including those related to shipping.

All products shall be shipped to Foley Stadium, 305 Chandler Street Worcester, MA 01602 and must
be received no fater than August 15, 2025.

Jotat
Unit Price Price

X

tem# | QTY | UOM Desgrlgtlon ‘J MEG / Model #
4

1

X ‘E.a. NM"G *" Lacrosse Bucket Ball Bag STIK -Bladlont

Black - Multi Sport Ball Bag # 1334444 $ a‘l-‘f‘l $_206‘03

7

2 10 Ea. Field Hockey Horns $ $
L
3 9 Ea. fng:zorlgggoor Agility Trainir'}g{:ﬂels :?:m l} 4y 5(5 < . $ qq qg $ 55” .'33.
Ea. |3€C CAtedg Adult Size - Varsity wiq (i f %
4 500 (Pair) F@Sport One Color Soccer Socks (White) # [14023b ;.7 W $ a -3’ $ |lqO
Adult Size Varsity All Sport one color Soccer Tooin c‘[l-a Ml
5 go0 | Ea socks. 200 Red, 100 Maroon, gxi 38 l“IO‘I &
= (Pair} 150 Forest Green, 150 Orange, 100 Black, $ 3 $
)i . 100RoyalBiue. <pp afaiod sabels
Ea. of" \ Volleyball Knee Pads BN speidy ¢
§ |0 (Pair)( ,B,ffﬁ-e 2075 SIM & 75 UXL {455 238 s [5-3¢ | 5 2389
™ Varsity Soccer Balls - NCAA Vivido Match  |Wilson pedVivid
7 |60 | Ea Soccer Balls, Official Ball of the MIAA and | NFItS S‘u-,-pm%s q4 9 $S0A3.9
NFHS Approved WIARS jo004D
o . B whtic o
8 200 Ea. V. High School Football Belts i .
B ° { "xarsuy' Li-gou o HD Doy ot nm:)b. ABBLTA i $ ?Q $ |L‘Ll
Orangé Field Hockey Balls
9 84 Ea. NFHS and MIAA Approved (official size and $ $
weight)
Practice Field Hockey Balls. Molded composite
10 84 Ea plastic construction for external use.
o ) Official size and weight for High School Field $ $
Hockey.
Low Profile Cones. Orange. Soft flexible and | BA) . .
1] 20 | Dozen | T easiy. 3" Hx 7 % "diameer ¥ 1355706 |52 88 | 51¢
Ea. Varsity High School Football padding. Knee Z‘C“l '38841# $ 2
B 12| e jwfevepen ﬁTﬂ hdlads.. o 3" Round sﬁéz’ s_820~
NS StieP il school Footballs Wi 77 Wilson 0 5
13325 | B o ballof tre MIAR and NFHS apprdfad Sl s 109498| s2714.
H WewF (007 ko[ TBOF
BSN SPORTS, LLC
PO BOX 7726

DAUAS, TX 752090726
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25

Ea.

Wilson TD Youth Footballs (composite)
premium composite leather construction with
ACL lacing systemA

(Wilsen 25T
speed g

lson

auth
ﬂ'k, |
Official size is NFHS approved. 4t ) W /20l N B

;319

4415

100

Ea.

Flag Football Beits. Three flags permanently
sewn onto the web beit. Entire belt
comes off. Vinyl coated polyester flag. Flag
size 2 W' Wx 14 34" L.

Heavy duty polyethylene gator clip.
Adjusting glide for sizing.

Sizes: 50 small, 25 medium, 20 large, 5 XL.

Tripe Thread
Specity cwlor 5
R‘&)%“”’l&a

or breen 3

. !.lpﬁ

s 169%

§7

Ea.

Adult Varsity High School Helmets. Must meet
NOCSAE standards. Shell must
be 2025 and must meet Virginia Tech Football
5 star rated for safety. Facemasks must
be attached and coincide with 2025 shells.
Chin straps must be included.
Color and sizes include:
34 Forest Green helmets (metallic) with White
facemasks: 7 Medium, 20 Large, 7 XL.
18 Vegas Gold heimets with White facemasks:

1 Medium, 14 Large, 3 XL
3 Extra Bright Siiver helmets with Sealtle Blue

-facemasks: 1 Medlum, 1 Large, 1 XL.
11 Black helmets with Gray facemasks: 2

Medium, 7 Large, 2 XL
1 White helmet with White facemasks: 1 Large.

250

Ea.
{Pair)

White High School Varsity Football practice
pants. Sizes include: 50 small,
50 medium, 50 large, 50 XL, 50 XXL.

200

Ea.

ol No Clear!

Mouthgu - Adult Strapless

lear and 100 Black

szi’dhiﬂ ov Black an‘ar 4

BIDDER NAME:

—

BSN SPORTS, LLC
PO BOX 7726
DALLAS, TX 7520907264




PRICING/SPECIFICATION PAGE — Athletic Equipment - Fall / WPS

Bid #: 8473-J6

The Worcester Public Schools are looking to purchase athletic equipment. The vendor shall provide pricing on

the following products.

?\W\AQ\\ /A\\ AVL\emcw\

Award to be made PER LINE {TEM. Bidder should ONLY bid items they can supply.

Bid shall include all associated fees, including those related to shipping.

All products shall be shipped to Foley Stadium, 305 Ch

be received no later than August 15, 2025.

andler Street Waorcester, MA 01602 and must

item# | QTY | UOM Description MFG / Model # | Unit Price ,T,:’I:;“;
1 7 Ea Lacrosse Bucket Ball Bag
= ‘ Black - Multi Sport Ball Bag $
2 10 Ea. Field Hockey Horns $
3 9 Ea. Indoor/Outdoor Agility Training Pole System $
Ea. Adult Size - Varsity Twin Ci
4 LY (Pair) All Sport One Color Soccer Socks (White) | OSK R4 $ 6.25 | $_3,125.00
Adult Size Varsity All Sport one color Soccer . :
5 800 Ea. socks. 200 Red, 100 Maroon, 8&2 Clty
= (Pair) 150 Forest Green, 150 Orange, 100 Black, $ 6.25 5,000.00
100 Royal Blue.
6 150 Ea. Volleyball Knee Pads
= (Pair) Sizes - 75 5/M & 75 LIXL $
Varsity Soccer Balls - NCAA Vivido Match
7 60 Ea. Soccer Balls, Official Ball of the MIAA and $
NFHS Approved
o _ RIDDELL #RWB58
8 200 Ea. Varsity High School Football Belts (White) 60" long 1"W football $ 1.25 250.00
Belts. - :
Orange Field Hockey Balls
9 84 Ea. NFHS and MIAA Approved (official size and $
weight)
Practice Field Hockey Balls. Molded composite
10 84 Ea plastic construction for external use.
- ' Official size and weight for High School Field $
Hockey.
Low Profile Cones. Orange. Soft flexible and
113 AN Bl stack easily. 3" H x 7 % "diameter $
12 250 Ea. Varsity High School Football padding. Knee Riddell BioLite
- (Pair) Pads. #R48159 $ 3.70 925.00
. Wilson
High School Footballs.
13 125 | B2 | Official ball of the MIAA and NFHS approved. (mg;To)osa $
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o
=

Description

MFEG / Model #

Unit Price

14 25

| 15 | 100

Ea.

Ea.

Wilson TD Youth Footballs {composite)
premium composite leather construction with
ACL lacing system.

Official size is NFHS approved.

Wilson

Flag Football Belts. Three flags permanently
sewn onto the web belt. Entire belt
comes off. Vinyl coated polyester flag. Flag
size 2 V" Wx 14 12" L.

Heavy duty polyethylene gator clip.
Adjusting glide for sizing.

Sizes: 50 small, 25 medium, 20 large, 5 XL.

Martin #TTA4
As specified

$ 273

$ 27300

Ea.

Adult Varsity High School Helmets. Must meet
NOCSAE standards. Shell must
be 2025 and must meet Virginia Tech Football
5 star rated for safety. Facemasks must
be attached and coincide with 2025 shells.
Chin straps must be included.
Color and sizes include:
34 Forest Green helmets (metallic) with White

facemasks: 7 Medium, 20 Large, 7 XL.
18 Vegas Gold helmets with White facemasks:

1 Medium, 14 Large, 3 XL
3 Extra Bright Silver helmets with Seattle Blue

facemasks: 1 Medium, 1 Large, 1 XL.
11 Black helmets with Gray facemasks: 2

Medium, 7 Large, 2 XL.
1 White helmet with White facemasks: 1 Large.

RIDDELL #R41195
Speed Flex.
Add$15.00/XL
and/or Paint*

$ 38000

$ 2565500

17 | 250

Ea.
(Pair)

White High School Varsity Football practice
pants. Sizes include: 50 small,
50 medium, 50 large, 50 XL, 50 XXL.

Riddell #RPPPC

$ 1175

$ 2,937.50

18 | 200

Ea.

Mouthguards - Adult Strapless
100 Clear and 100 Black

ASI: #MG7

$ 169

$_ 338.00

Contact your local RIDDELL sales representative
David Schoenfeld for details at: daschoefeld@riddellsales.com
or by phone at: 978-973-9519

BIDDER NAME:

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN
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Bid #: 8473-06

PRICING/SPECIFICATION PAGE — Athletic Equipment - Fall / WPS

The Worcester Public Schools are locking to purchase athletic equipment. The vendor shall provide pricing on

the following products.

« Award to be made PER LINE ITEM. Bidder should ONLY bid items they can supply.

)?ijmiJ\ School f rodkucts

e Bid shall include all associated fees, including those related to shipping.
e All products shall be shipped to Foley Stadium, 305 Chandler Street Worcester, MA 01602 and must
be received no later than August 15, 2025.. , us# rECENS P.o {j 7-/8-25

tem# | QTY | UOM Description MFG / Model # | Unit Price :
- o —_— Price
Lacrosse Bucket Balt Bag CHAMPIZN qé @
1 |7 | B Black - Multi Sport Ball Bag %8 § 89.5¢ |g 43
2 10 Ea. Field Hockey Horns $ NEL ] $ —
CuAmbion ==
3 9 Ea. Indoor/Qutdoor Agility Training Pole Sysle l LY
‘o sQck N6 STICKS Wity RAS %K 60 s 131 $qu
Ea. Adult Size - Varsily EARSX ,
4 500 | o | AllSport One Color Soccer Socks (White) |4 ASWWAD | $ 3,95 |/05A
Adult Size Varsity All Sport one color Soccer SARY
5 800 Ea. socks. 200 Red, 100 Maroon, PEARS X 3 [ O
= (Pai) | 150 Forest Green, 150 Orange, 100 Black, | # (6. corn a0 | § o5 | /6407
100 Royal Blue. s
8 150 | Ea M, Hi’ﬁ"’\'}oueybau Knee Pads crinfiz 10.99 I 6({85
e (Pair) |4+ LARyZ Sizes-75SIM & 75 LIXL [y 3201 g1~ $
Varsity Soccer Balls  NCAA Vividp Match wHi§oN
7 60 Ea. Soccer Balls, Official Ball 0 |AA and . $ ‘] HS‘ $Sm7ﬁ
NFHS Approved w§ (00428
o ) CrlAMB ' o Qe
8 200 Ea. Varsity High School Football Belts (White) F ‘,’ R3wH g !- AY : Z /
Orange Field Hockey Balls CuamMPiyN
2 84 Ea. NFHS and MIAA Approved (official size and £uRioR $ 3 ) 3 SZ/ZE
Peicid Ry £n0v_ weight) Sopd By 0e2<N
; Practice Field Hockey Balls. Molded composite O Pian)
! plastic construction for exlernal use. U -] /8{/
| 12 | 8 | Ea Official size and weight for High School Field Fusa g 3.39 |3g/0Y 8_",
pRyczd BY gnevHockey. Sat0 AY -
Low Profile Cones. Orange. Soft flexible and CUAM e
u Y Dozen stack easily. 3" H x 7 % "diameter SCX Lol $ 5. 3 ¥ $/ D go
Ea. Varsity High School Football padding. Knee CHAMER) ﬂ
12250 | o Pads. CKP Y s 345 |s482%
High School Footballs, fison
3 e 25 Official ball of the MIAA and NFHS approved. @TSQE;JSB $ l 93-% m_:g

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Streei
Tampa, Flonda 33610-150%

PLEASE SEND 1S
A COPY OF RECAJ*
THANK YOQU!



Description

MFG / Model #

Unit Price

25

Ea.

Wilson TD Youth Footballs (composite}
premium composite leather construction with
ACL lacing system.

Official size is NFHS approved.

Wilson

W) 2063 XBY4

s 3699

R
N
P

100

Ea.

Flag Football Belts. Three flags permanently
sewn onto the web belt. Entire belt
comes off. Vinyl coated polyester flag. Flag
size 2 "W x 14 2" L.

Heavy duty polyethylene gator clip.
Adjusting glide for sizing.

Sizes: 50 small, 25 medium, 20 large, 5 XL.

CHAm oV
TEF-S1zs-0R

{SmALL, MO ‘M‘,
L6/x)

s 0.99

67

Ea.

Adult Varsity High School Helmets. Must meet
NOCSAE standards. Shell must
be 2025 and must meet Virginia Tech Football
5 star rated for safety. Facemasks must
be attached and coincide with 2025 shells.
Chin straps must be included.
Color and sizes include:
34 Forest Green helmets (metallic) with White

facemasks: 7 Medium, 20 Large, 7 XL.
18 Vegas Gold helmets with White facemasks:

1 Medium, 14 Large, 3 XL
3 Extra Bright Silver heimets with Seatile Blue

facemasks: 1 Medium, 1 Large, 1 XL.
11 Black heimets with Gray facemasks: 2
Medium, 7 Large, 2 XL.
1 White helmet with White facemasks: 1 Large.

250

Ea.
(Pair)

White High School Varsity Football practice
pants. Sizes include: 50 small,
50 medium, 50 large, 50 XL, 50 XXL.

C ufAmpRd
FPIa

200

Ea.

Mouthguards - Adult Strapless
100 Clear and 100 Black

CvamPRO
AFSY

BIDDER NAME:

Pricdd By eacy

Soud R 59/PK4

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, Florida 33610-1908




Bid #: 8473-J6

PRICING/SPECIFICATION PAGE — Athletic Equipment - Fall / WPS

The Worcester Public Schools are looking to purchase athletic equipment. The vendor shall provide pricing on

the following products.

¢ Award to be made PER LINE ITEM. Bidder should ONLY bid items they can supply.

School  Heudith Corporation

¢ Bid shall include all associated fees, including those related to shipping.

e All products shall be shipped to Foley Stadium, 305 Chandler Street Worcester, MA 01602 and must
be received no later than August 15, 2025.

ftem# | QTY | UOM Description MFG [ Model # | UnitPrice | foul
1 7 Ea Lacrosse Bucket Bail Bag
S ‘ Black - Multi Sport Ball Bag No Bid $ $
2 10 Ea. Field Hockey Horns No Bid $ $
Ea. Indoor/Qutdoor Agility Training Pole Syst .
3 9 a ndoor/Outdoor Agility Training Pole System No Bid $ $
4 500 Ea. Adult Size - Varsity
= (Pair} All Sport One Color Soccer Socks (White) No Bid $ $
Adult Size Varsity All Sport one color Soccer
Ea. socks. 200 Red, 100 Maroon, .
5 1800 | pairy | 150 Forest Green, 150 Orange, 100 Biack, No Bid '$ $
100 Royal Blue.
Ea. Volleyball Knee Pads 33098PS (white}
& | ™0 (pain Sizes - 75 S/M & 75 LIXL 33009PS (black) | §16.24 _ | 52436.00
Varsity Soccer Balls - NCAA Vivido Match
7 60 Ea. Soccer Balls, Official Ball of the MIAA and $ $
NFHS Approved No Bid
8 200 Ea. Varsity High School Football Belts (White .
8 a arsity High Sc (White) No Bid $ $
Orange Field Hockey Balls
9 84 Ea. NFHS and MIAA App_roved (official size and No Bid $ $
weight)
Practice Field Hockey Balls. Molded composite
10 84 Ea plastic construction for external use.
: Official size and weight for High School Field . $ $
Hockey. No Bid
Low Profile Cones. Orange. Soft flexible and
L AU Ry stack easily. 3" H x 7 % "diameter 66480PS 50/case | $.24.74 $494.80
12 250 Ea. Varsity High School Football padding. Knee
12 (Pair) Pads. No Bid $ $
i Wilson
High School Footballs.
3 | 25 | Ea | Official ball of the MIAA and NFHS approved. (WT(';;TO)OQ’B $108.69 |52717.25

32005PS




Description

MEG / Model #

Unit Price

Total
Price

25

Ea.

Wilson TD Youth Footballs (composite)
premium composite leather construction with
ACL lacing system.

Official size is NFHS approved.

Wilson
1038460PS

§ 22.56

g 564.00

100

Ea.

Flag Football Belts. Three flags permanently
sewn onto the web belt. Entire beit
comes off. Vinyl coated polyester flag. Flag
size 2 Ya" Wx 14 12" L.

Heavy duty polyethylene gator clip.
Adjusting glide for sizing.

Sizes: 50 small, 25 medium, 20 large, 5 XL.

No Bid

67

Ea.

Adult Varsity High School Helmets. Must meet
NQOCSAE standards. Shell must
be 2025 and must meet Virginia Tech Football
5 star rated for safety. Facemasks must
be attached and coincide with 2025 shells.
Chin straps must be included.
Color and sizes include:
34 Forest Green helmets (metallic) with White

facemasks: 7 Medium, 20 Large, 7 XL.
18 Vegas Gold helmets with White facemasks:

1 Medium, 14 Large, 3 XL
3 Extra Bright Silver helmets with Seattie Blue

facemasks: 1 Medium, 1 Large, 1 XL.
11 Black helmets with Gray facemasks: 2

Medium, 7 Large, 2 XL.
1 White helmet with White facemasks: 1 Large.

No Bid

250

Ea.
(Pair)

White High School Varsity Football practice
pants. Sizes include: 50 small,
50 medium, 50 large, 50 XL, 50 XXL.

No Bid

200

Ea.

Mouthguards - Adult Strapless
100 Clear and 100 Black

90604 black

$1.78

§ 356.00

BIDDER NAME: School Health Corporation

no clear option without strap




The Worcester Public Schools are looking to purchase athletic equipment. The vendor shall provide pricing on

the foliowing products.

Qiebco S?of\'”\a’ (}00&5

e Award to be made PER LINE ITEM. Bidder should ONLY bid items they can supply.
e Bid shall include all associated fees, including those related to shipping. '
e All products shall be shipped to Foley Stadium, 305 Chandler Street Worcester, MA 01602 and must

be received no later than August 15, 2025.

*

fem# | QTY | UO Description . | MEG/Model# | UnitPrice | 1o
Lacrosse Bucket Ball Bag
1 E - Black - Multi Sport Ball Bag ESChampro | ¢ 1675 | 117.25
2 10 Ea. Field Hockey Homs S-13530 ULINE $ 27.50 $ 275
3 9 Ea. Indoor/Outdoor Agility Training Pole System | 16822 Kwik Goal ¢ 262 ¢ 2538
]
. Ea. Adult Size - Varsity 7 TSK Twin Ci
4 | 500 | (paiy | Al Sport One Color Soccer Socks (White) neiyl ¢ 2.72 g_1360
Adult Size Varsity All Sport one color Soccer
Ea. socks. 200 Red, 100 Maroon, .
5 | 8% | (pair) | 150 Forest Green, 150 Orange, 100 Black, TSKIwinClty | ¢ 272 | ¢ 2176
100 Royal Blue.
Ea. Volleyball Knee Pads
8 | 1901 (paiy Sizes - 75 S/M & 75 UXL A3001 Champrg ¢ 11.54 | g 171
Varsity Soccer Balls - NCAA Vivido Match
7 60 Ea. Soccer Balls, Official Ball of the MIAA and ¢ 90.85 $ 5451
NFHS Approved
8 200 | Ea Varsity High School Football Belts {White) FW8 Champro g 105 [g 210
Orange Field Hockey Balls
9 84 | Ea NFHS and MIAA Approved (official size and HB4 Gryphon g 391 284.84
i weight)
Practice Field Hockey Balls. Molded composite
10 84 Ea plast_ic construction for e?ctemal use. HBS Longstrength 2.84 238.56
— ‘ Official size and weight for High School Field $
Hockey.
Low Profile Cones. Orange. Soft flexible and 6A1011 Kwik Goal 7.75 155
- |20 || Pozen stack easily. 3" H x 7 % "diameter $ $
12 250 Ea. Varsity High School Football padding. Knee FKPUL-A Champfo 5.35 1337.50
— (Pair) Pads. $ $
. Wilson
High School Footballs. 104.20 2605
B 125 [ B2 | Oficial ball of the MIAA and NFHS approved. (wrgg%osa $ $




Description

MFG / Model #

Unlt Price

25

Ea.

Wilson TD Youth Footballs (composite)
premium composite leather construction with
ACL lacing system.

Official size is NFHS approved.

WF1006201

Wilson

47.20

1180

100

Ea.

Flag Foothall Belts. Three flags permanently
sewn onto the web belt. Entire belt
comes off. Vinyl coated polyester flag. Flag
size 2 V" Wx 14 4" L.

Heavy duty polyethylene gator clip.
Adjusting glide for sizing.

Sizes: 50 small, 25 medium, 20 large, 5 XL.

A108 Champrd

§ 7.70

770

67

Ea.

Adult Varsity High Schoo!l Helmets. Must meet
NOCSAE standards. Shell must
be 2025 and must meet Virginia Tech Football
5 star rated for safety. Facemasks must
be attached and coincide with 2025 shells.
Chin straps must be included.
Color and sizes include;
34 Forest Green helmets {metallic) with White

facemasks: 7 Medlum, 20 Large, 7 XL.
18 Vegas Gold helmets with White faCemasks:
1 Medium, 14 Large, 3 XL -

3 Extra Bright Silver helmets with Seattle Biue

facemasks: 1 Medium, 1 Large, 1 XL.
11 Black helmels with Gray facemasks: 2

Medium, 7 Large, 2 XL.
1 White heimet with White facemasks: 1 Large.

250

Ea.
(Pair)

White High School Varsity Football practice
pants. Sizes include: 50 small,
50 medium, 50 large, 50 XL, 50 XXI..

610SL Allsson

$ 11.70

2925

200

Ea.

Mouthguards - Adult Strapless
100 Clear and 100 Black

.57

114

BIDDER NAME: Piesco Sporting Goods




PRICING/SPECIFICATION PAGE — Athletic Equipment - Fall / WPS

Bid #: 8473-J6

The Worcester Public Schools are looking to purchase athletic equipment. The vendor shall provide pricing on
the following products.

fome Yeum Adhletic

Award to be made PER LINE ITEM. Bidder should ONLY bid items they can supply.

Bid shall include all associated fees, including those related to shipping.

All products shall be shipped to Foley Stadium, 305 Chandler Street Worcester, MA 01602 and must
be received no later than August 15, 2025.

Item# | QTY | UOM Description MFG / Model # | Unit Price ;:?e'
Lacrosse Bucket Ball Bag (O HArng0
1 7 Ea. Black - Multi Sport Ball Bag #ES $ 5’ 7 $ 24 %
2 10 Ea. Field Hockey Horns $ $
3 9 Ea. Indoor/Outdoor Agility Training Pole System $ $
Ea. Adult Size - Varsity Ch _
4 iy (Pair) All' Sport One Color Soccer Socks (White) 1;2{:‘539 $ q’:gf $ /_; 995. %
Adult Size Varsity All Sport one color Soccer
5 800 Ea. socks. 200 Red, 100 Maroon, U"W’“‘ %
2 (Pair) | 150 Forest Green, 150 Orange, 100 Black, $ d. $ R A e
100 Royal Blue. #Asa
6 |150]| E& Volleyball Knee Pads Chopuo 1373 | s2059.54
{Pair) Sizes - 75 SIM & 75 LIXL 24 200/ $ .= 1§ ] .
Varsity Soccer Balls - NCAA Vivido Match
7 60 Ea. Soccer Balls, Official Ball of the MIAA and $ $
NFHS Approved
8 20| E Varsity Hi i hippad / o7 2,332
8 a. arsity High School Football Belts (White) HEEW $ /- Lo |g £z
Orange Field Hockey Balls
9 84 Ea. NFHS and MIAA Approved (official size and $ $
weight)
Practice Field Hockey Balls. Molded composite
10 84 Ea ptastic construction for external use.
- ) Official size and weight for High Schoal Field $ $
Hockey.
Low Profile Cones. Orange. Soft flexible and
n ==t stack easily. 3" H x 7 3% "diameter $ $
Ea. Varsity High School Football padding. Knee Aol sooxd- Ys .
12 1250 (pai Pads. Ny | s o s2963.52
: Wilson
High Schoot Footballs.
13 e = Official ball of the MIAA and NFHS approved. (WTESJ%OSB $ $




Qry UOM Description

Wilson TD Youth Footballs (composite)

25 Ea premium composite leather construction with
: ACL lacing system.

Official size is NFHS approved.

Flag Football Belts. Three flags permanently
sewn onto the web belt. Entire belt
comes off. Vinyl coated polyester flag. Flag

100 Ea. size 2 4" W x 14 4" L.
Heavy duty polyethylene gator clip.
Adjusting glide for sizing.

Sizes: 50 small, 25 medium, 20 large, 5 XL.

Adult Varsity High School Helmets. Must meet
NOCSAE standards. Shell must
be 2025 and must meet Virginia Tech Football
3 star rated for safety. Facemasks must
be attached and coincide with 2025 shells.
Chin straps must be included.
Color and sizes include:
67 Ea 34 Forest Green helmets (metallic) with White

facemasks: 7 Medium, 20 Large, 7 XL.
18 Vegas Gold heimets with White facemasks:

1 Medium, 14 Large, 3 XL
3 Extra Bright Silver helmets with Seattle Biue
facemasks: 1 Medium, 1 Large, 1 XL.
11 Black helmets with Gray facemasks: 2

Medium, 7 Large, 2 XL.
1 White helmet with White facemasks: 1 Large.

2

Ea | White High School Varsity Football practice
250 P ai;') pants. Sizes inciude: 50 small,
50 medium, 50 la_rge, 50 XL, 50 )(XL7

Mouthguards - Adult Strapless
AU L S 100 Clear and 100 Black

BIDDER NAME: /%/vré‘ éf,t&!n W‘IL@M

HOME T™ —E .AM
ATHLE ™—XCS

AE—ALETEC FQUIPMENT SALES e SPOHIS MEDICING
= ( EB--cerdeader / Soccer Supplies © Varsity Jackets
Embioidery * Trophies 1 Awards

o
Triangle Shopping Cent
242 S, Wi1rpington. H\gz‘
Eg:g; ggg?ggg ' IE:: - Jacksonville, NC 28
email: r;omet

CUSTOM TEAM UNIFORMS  ———
Releree / Official Supplie====
Screen Prim e

—;,ar-malhletics@embarqrnail.com
—————



Bid #: 8473-)6

PRICING/SPECIFICATION PAGE - Athletic Equipment - Fall / WPS

The Worcester Public Schools are looking to purchase athletic equipment. The vendor shall provide pricing on
the following products.

\’a\hcw\ C,Ov\ir\rutj\”mg,

Award to be made PER LINE ITEM. Bidder should ONLY bid items they can supply.

Bid shall include all associated fees, including those related to shipping.

LLC

All products shall be shipped to Foley Stadium, 305 Chandler Street Worcester, MA 01602 and must
be received no later than August 15, 2025.

tem# | QTY | uoMm Description MEG/Model # | UnitPrice | To
1 7 Ea Lacrosse Bucket Ball Bag STX/ Lacrosse
- ' Black - Multi Sport Ball Bag Bucket Ball Bag | $_37.09 | $259.58
, Saillong /
2 10 Ea. Field Hockey Horns BOD1R38CNV | $ 9.53 $ 95.3
. - BSN Sports /
3 9 Ea. Indoor/Outdoor Agility Training Pole System 1248555 $ 155.12 | ¢ 1396.08
Ea. Adult Size - Varsity
4 S0 (Pair) All Sport One Color Soccer Socks (White) TCK/C20 $_5.08 $_2540
Adult Size Varsity All Sport one color Soccer
5 800 Ea. socks. 200 Red, 100 Maroon,
= {Pair) 1560 Forest Green, 150 Orange, 100 Black, 3 $
100 Royal Blue.
6 150 Ea. Volleyball Knee Pads Under Armour /
= (Pair) Sizes - 75 S/M & 75 LIXL UA21500 $_3180 |$4770.00
Varsity Soccer Balls - NCAA Vivido Match Wilson Vivido
7 60 Ea. Soccer Balls, Official Ball of the MIAA and Official Match
NFHS Approved Ball / WS 100090] *—118:88 | 871328
8 200 Ea. Varsity High School Football Belts (White) Egggswk:zlg / § 14.07 § 2814
Orange Field Hockey Balls
9 B4 Ea. NFHS and MIAA Approved (official size and $ $
weight)
Practice Field Hockey Balls. Molded composite
10 84 Ea plastic construction for external use. Longstreth /
- ' Official size and weight for High School Field HB6 $ 412 $ 346.08
Hockey.
1 20 Dozen Low Profile Cones. Orange. Soft flexible and |Gamecraft /
e stack easily. 3" H x 7 % "diameter 00842569082338 $_14.31 | g 286.2
12 250 Ea. Varsity High School Football padding. Knee
= {Pair) Pads. $ $
i3 |25 | Eas High School Footballs. (W‘T"Iﬂ'ﬁg’am
s * | Official ball of the MIAA and NFHS approved. as) $_127.15 | $3178.75




Item #

Description

MEG / Model #

Unit Price

25

Ea.

Wilson TD Youth Footballs (composite)
premium composite leather construction with
ACL lacing system.

Official size is NFHS approved.

Wilson

100

Ea.

Flag Football Belts. Three flags permanently
sewn onto the web belt. Entire belt
comes off. Vinyl coated polyester flag. Flag
size 2 Ya"Wx 14 %" L.

Heavy duty polyethylene gator clip.
Adjusting glide for sizing.

Sizes: 50 small, 25 medium, 20 large, 5 XL.

67

Ea.

Adult Varsity High School Helmets. Must meet
NOCSAE standards. Shell must
be 2025 and must meet Virginia Tech Football
5 star rated for safety. Facemasks must
be attached and coincide with 2025 shells.
Chin straps must be included.
Color and sizes include:
34 Forest Green heimets (metallic) with White
facemasks: 7 Medium, 20 Large, 7 XL.
18 Vegas Gold helmets with White facemasks:
1 Medium, 14 Large, 3 XL
3 Extra Bright Silver helmets with Seattle Blue
facemasks: 1 Medium, 1 Large, 1 XL.
11 Black helmets with Gray facemasks: 2

Medium, 7 Large, 2 XL.
1 White helmet with White facemasks: 1 Large.

250

Ea.
{Pair)

White High School Varsity Football practice
pants. Sizes include: 50 small,
50 medium, 50 large, 50 XL, 50 XXL.

200

Ea.

Mouthguards - Adult Strapless
100 Clear and 100 Black

BIDDER NAME: Vivian Contracting LLC




PRICING/SPECIFICATION PAGE - Athletic Equipment - Fall / WPS
Bid #: 8473-J6

The Worcester Public Schools are looking to purchase athletic equipment. The vendor shall provide pricing on

the following products. 9 Tf«& b m Stj 53\-( ~

e Award to be made PER LINE ITEM. Bidder should ONLY bid items they can supply.
¢ Bid shall include all associated fees, including those related to shipping.

e All products shall be shipped to Foley Stadium, 305 Chandler Street Worcester, MA 01602 and must
be received no later than August 15, 2025.

ltem# | QTY | UOM Description MFG / Model # | Unit Price ;:_’It:el
1 7 Ea Lacrosse Bucket Ball Bag
= ' Black - Multi Sport Ball Bag $ $
2 10 Ea. Field Hockey Horns $ $
3 9 Ea. Indoor/Outdoor Agility Training Pole System $ $
- -

4 500 | Ea Adult Size - Varsity | ‘\
2 (Pair) All Sport One Color Soccer Socks (White) / $ 4R

Adult Size Varsity All Sport one color Soccer / \ v
5 800 Ea. socks. 200 Red, 100 Maroon, )

{Pair} 150 Forest Green, 150 Orange, 100 Black, $ $
100 Royal Blue. L
' L
6 150 Ea. Volleyball Knee Pads J /“— 4 /
= {Pair) Sizes-75S/M & 75 LIXL $ \ $ ,
Varsity Soccer Balls - NCAA Vivido Match J - /
7 60 Ea. Soccer Balls, Official Ball of the MIAA and 3 As
NFHS Approved ~ —
8 |200| Ea Varsity High School Football Belts (White) / .
Orange Field Hockey Balls -~ '
9 84 Ea. NFHS and MIAA Approved (official size and $ $
weight)
Practice Field Hockey Balls. Molded composite

10 84 Ea plastic construction for extemnal use.

Official size and weight for High School Field $ $

Hockey.

Low Profile Cones. Orange. Soft flexible and
n Ol B stack easily. 3" H x 7 % "diameter $ $
12 250 Ea. Varsity High School Football padding. Knee
e {Pair) Pads. $ $

. Wilson
High School Footballs.

13 | 25 | Ea |} oficial ball of the MIAA and NFHS approved. (WTC';;TO)MB $ $




-

(=
o
=

Description

MFG / Model #

Unit Price

25

Ea.

Wilson TD Youth Footballs {composite)
premium composite leather construction with
ACL Jacing system.

Official size is NFHS approved.

Wilson

100

Ea.

Flag Football Belts. Three flags permanently
sewn onfo the web belt. Entire belt
comes off, Vinyt coated polyester flag. Flag
size 2" Wx 14 2" L.

Heavy duty polyethylene gator clip.
Adjusting glide for sizing.

Sizes: 50 small, 25 mediurn, 20 jarge, 5 XL.

67

Adult Varsity High School Helmets. Must meet
NOCSAE standards. Shell must
be 2025 and must meet Virginia Tech Football
5 star rated for safety. Facemasks must
be attached and coincide with 2025 shells.
Chin straps must be included.
Color and sizes include:
34 Forest Green helmets (metallic) with White

facemasks: 7 Medium, 20 Large, 7 XL.
18 Vegas Gold helmets with White facemasks:

1 Medium, 14 Large, 3 Xt
3 Extra Bright Silver helmets with Seattle Blue

facemasks: 1 Medium, 1 Large, 1 XL.
11 Black helmets with Gray facemasks: 2

Medium, 7 Large, 2 XL.
1 White helmet with White facemasks: 1 Large.

250

Ea.
{Pair)

White High School Varsity Football practice
pants. Sizes include: 50 small,
50 medium, 50 large, 50 XL, 50 XXL.

200

Ea.

Mouthguards - Adult Strapless
100 Clear and 100 Black

BIDDER NAME:

FrXan 9§ ke m




.' S*‘“Xmm ) Stjﬂ‘w{ Yone

Item #

Uom

Description

Total Price

Ea.

Lacrosse Bucket Ball Bag Black - Multi Sport Ball Bag

$25.00

$175.00

10

Ea.

Field Hockey Homs

$18.00

$180.00

Ea.

Indoor/Qutdoor Agility Training Pole System

$204.99

$1,844.91

altain

500

Ea. (Pair)

Adult Size - Varsity
All Sport One Color Soccer Socks (White)

$4.49

$2,245.00

800

Ea. (Pair)

Adult Size Varsity All Sport one color Soccer socks, 200 Red, 100
Maroon,

150 Forest Green, 150 Orange, 100 Black,

100 Royal Blue.

$1.96

$1,568.00

150

Ea. (Pair}

Volleyball Knee Pads Sizes - 75 S/IM & 75 L/XL

$11.29

$1,693.50

60

Ea.-

Varsity Soccer Balls - NCAA Vivido Match Soccer Balls, Official Bail of
the MIAA and NFHS Approved

$79.99

$4,799.40

200

Ea.

Varsity High School Football Bells {White}

$0.91

$182.00

Ea.

Orange Field Hockey Balls
NFHS and MIAA Approved (official size and weight)

$51.99

$4,367.16

10

R|R

Ea.

Practice Field Hockey Balls. Molded composite plastic construction for
external use.
Official size and weight for High School Field Hockey.

$28.99

$2,435.16

1"

20

Dozen

Low Profile Cones. Orange. Soft flexible and stack easily. 3"Hx 7 %
"diameter v 5

- $6.00

$120.00

12

250

Ea. (Pair)

Varsity High School Football padding. Knee Pads.

$3.77

$942.50

13

25

Ea.

High Schaol Footballs.
Official ball of the MIAA and NFHS approved.

$99.99

$2,499.75

UOM

Description

14

25

Ea.

Wilson TD Youth Footballs {composite} premium composite leather
construction with ACL lacing system.
Official size is NFHS approved.

$29.75

$743.75

15

100

Ea.

Flag Football Bélts. Three flags permanently sewn onto the web belt.
Entire belt:

comes off, Viriyl coated polyester flag. Flag size 2 14" W x 14 %" L.
Heavy duty polysthylene gator clip.

Adjusting glide for sizing.

Sizes: 50 small, 25 medium, 20 large, 5 XL.

$2.25

$225.00

16

67

Adult Varsity High School Helmets. Must meet NOCSAE standards.
Shellmust - ° :

be 2025 and must meet Virginia Tech Football 5 star rated for safety.
Facemasks must

be attached and coincide with 2025 shells.

Chin straps must be included.

Color and sizes include:

34 Forest Green helmets (metallic) with White facemasks: 7 Medium,
20 Large, 7 XL.

18 Vegas Gold helmets with White facemasks:

1 Medium, 14 Large, 3 XL

3 Extra Bright Silver helmets with Seattle Blue facemasks: 1 Medium,
1 Large, 1 XL. :

11 Black helmets with Gray facemasks: 2 Medium, 7 Large, 2 XL.

1 White helmet with White facemasks: 1 Large.

67

XENITH X2E FOOTBALL HELMETS WITH MASK

$229.99

$15,409.33

67

SCHUTT VENGEANCE PRO FOOTBALL HELMETS WITH MASK

$279.99

$18,759.33

67

SCHUTT F7 VTD FGOTBALL HELMETS WITH MASK

$349.99

$23,449.33

55

HELMET PAINT -

$17.00

$935.00

13

2 BIE(F|F|F

XL UPCHARGE

$20.00

$260.00

$0.00

$0.00

oty ‘. .
- 6‘*&.
ks




$0.00

17

250

Ea. (Pair)

White High Schogl Varsity Football practice pants. Sizes include: 50
small,
50 medium, 50 large, 50 XL, 50 XXL.

$10.79

$2,697.50

18

200

Ea

Mouthguards - Adult Strapless 100 Clear and 100 Black

$0.60

$120.00

BIDDER NAME: STADI

UM SYSTEM, INC.

.




