

AUTOMOTIVE TECHNOLOGY BID PRICING PAGE

Item No.	Est. Qty	Description	MFG. / MODEL #	Unit Price	Total Price
1	2	2 1/2 11pc shallow socket set	SNAP-ON 111TMMDY		no bid
2	2	2 1/2 11pc deep socket set	SNAP-ON 1115TMMDY		no bid
3	2	2 1/2 12pc shallow socket set	SNAP-ON 212FMY		no bid
4	2	2 1/2 12pc socket set	SNAP-ON 212FSMY		no bid
5	2	2 13pc met combo wrench set	SNAP-ON OSHM713		no bid
6	2	BATTERY CHARGER PLUS	SNAP-ON EEB5C500B		no bid
7	4	BATTERY CHARGER WITH CEC	SNAP-ON EEB5C100A		no bid
8	1	APOLLO D9 CERTIFICATION KIT Apollo cert training	SNAP-ON APD9CERTKIT		no bid
9	1	METER CERT KIT W/EEDM596F METER CERT TRAINING	SNAP-ON S96FMETERKIT		no bid
10	1	TORQUE CERT KIT SECONDARY TORQUE CERT TRAINING	SNAP-ON TORQCERTKITS		no bid
11	1	PRECISION MSRMNT CERT KIT V2 PRECISION CERT TRAINING	SNAP-ON PMICERTKIT2		no bid
12	1	BATT START CHARG-SECONDARY BATT CERT TRAINING	SNAP-ON BSCCER750		no bid
13	2	BATTERY CHARGER PLUS - LIFEPO4	SNAP-ON EEB5C500B		no bid
14	2	BATTERY SYSTEM TESTER W/PRINT	SNAP-ON EEC5750A		no bid
15	2	Tool sets W/FOAM & ETCH SET	SNAP-ON 9400GMBO'S		no bid
16	1	Tool set W/FOAM & ETCH SET	SNAP-ON 9300GMBO		no bid
17	1	Build-a-Bay			no bid
18	12	TIL 42XL XL PIGSKIN MIG GLV	Tillman		no bid
19	12	TIL 42M MD PIGSKIN MIG GLV	Tillman		no bid
20	10	110LB IN 1170S6023 ER 70S 0.023+11LB SPOOL	ER 70S		no bid
21	2	VICO384-2126 PERFORMER 540/300 EDGE	Victor Performer VICO384-2126		no bid
22	12	LIBWAH800D-TCXL WASHINGTON ALLOYS ULTRAVIEW PLUS	LIBWAH800D-TCXL		no bid
23	6	LIBWAH800TC WASHINGTON ALLOYS KLEARVIEW HELMET	LIBWAH800TC		no bid
24	4	MIL951601 PKG MILLERMATIC 141 W/RUNNING GEAR/CYLIN	MIL951601 PKG MILLERMATIC 141		no bid
25	1	MIL 951603 PKG MILLERMATIC 211 W/RUNNING GEAR/CYLIN	MIL 951603 PKG MILLERMATIC 211		no bid
26	50	MILT-MO23 CONTACT TIP, ACCULOCK MDX .023	MILT-MO23		no bid
27	10	MILNS-M1200C MDX100 NZL ASY, 1/2 ORFC	MILNS-M1200C MDX100		no bid
28	5	MILD-M100 DIFF, ACCULOCK MDX, MDX-100	MILD-M100		no bid
29	2	MIL1770028 MDX-100.10FT .030-.035 ACCULUCK MDX	MIL1770028		no bid
30	5	MILLM2A-10 LINER .030-.035 10" MDX-100	MILLM2A-10		no bid
31	2	POWERMAX30 XP SYSTEM 120-240V 1-PH CSA	HYP088079		no bid

Bidder Name: LAFED Air To Supply Co Inc.

AUTOMOTIVE TECHNOLOGY BID PRICING PAGE

Item No.	Est. Qty	Description	MFG. / MODEL #	Unit Price	Total Price
32	6	SHIELD, DURAMAX LT, 15-30A	HYP420116		no bid
33	6	RETAINING CAP, DURAMAX LT, 15-30A	HYP420114		no bid
34	15	NOZZLE, DURAMAX LT 15-30A STANDARD CU	HYP420118		no bid
35	15	ELECTRODE, DURAMAX LT, 15-30A	HYP420120		no bid
36	15	WIRL RING DURAMAX LT, 15-50A	HYP420211		no bid
37	1	RTI AC RRR MACHINE	#4608044500		no bid
38	1	LMP DSP CABINET MINIATURE			no bid
39	4	NLE 3.5 TON SERVICE JACK	#7916420		no bid
40	1	Abrasive SAND BLAST CABINET	Cyclone Model 4826		no bid
41	1	AIR OVER HYDRAULIC HD OIL FILTER CRUSHER	OTC Model 1877		no bid
42	1	AMA 50-TON PNEUMATIC SHOP PRESS	#HSP-50-A		no bid
43	4	BK. OIL DRAIN	#815-1266		no bid
44	2	NLE RAM KIT 4 TON	#791-3575		no bid
45	1	CHT DUAL EVAP	DEVTAK		no bid
46	2	DHC HD TESTER W PRINTER	#CBT6000HD		no bid
47	4	SOR JUMP STARTER	#CJS12V600A		no bid
48	4	BK TITANIUM DRILL BIT -29P	# TD29		no bid
49	4	MIL IMPACT WRENCH	#2767-22GR		no bid
50	4	MIL M18 IMPDR	#2953-22		no bid
51	4	MIL M81 HMR DRILL	#2903-22		no bid
52	4	MIL RECIPROCATING SAW	#2821-21		no bid
53	2	MIL GRINDER	#288022		no bid
54	4	MIL POLISHER	#2738-20		no bid
55	4	MIL HEAT GUN	#2688-20		no bid
56	4	MIL WET DRY VACUUM	#0880-20		no bid
57	4	IDEALER CABINET ASST	#899-2426		no bid
58	2	NTE UNIV HYD FLARING TOOL	#78-3200		no bid
59	5	BK TWIN BULB DROP LIGHT	#7827107		no bid

Bidder Name: LAPPEN Auto Supply Co Inc

AUTOMOTIVE TECHNOLOGY BID PRICING PAGE

Item No.	Est. Qty	Description	MFG. / MODEL #	Unit Price	Total Price
60	4	ATD TPMS BACKPACK BUNDLE	NAPATPMSBP		no bid
61	1	Fully Integrated Computerized Wheel Alignment Machine w/Lift Platform	Hunter Engineering Company Model #WA685, HE421CM, 20-2882-1, 20-2664-1, 20-2511-1, 20-2621-1, RX12KFSPRR, 20-3438-1, 20-2801-1		78,258.00
62	1	ADAS -Advanced Driver Assist Calibration Equipment	Hunter Engineering Company Model #DAS3000 KIT, ADASLINK SCAN TOOL		27,434.00
63	2	Road Force Tire Balancer	Hunter Engineering Company Model #RFE12, 20-369-1, 20-3116-1, 20-1207-1		43,571.00 **
64	1	Bench Brake Lathe, Combination Rotor and Drum Lathe	Hunter Engineering Company Model #BL73, 20-2615-1, 175-423-2		15,944.00
65	1	Automotive Tire Changer #1	Hunter Engineering Company Model #TCA34R, RP6-G1000A87, 20-2341-1		32,063.79
66	1	Automotive Tire Changer #2	Hunter Engineering Company Model #TC39SSW, RPG-G1000A87, 20-2341-1		23,630.60

**Item 63 calls for a 20-369-1. This is an incorrect part#. The correct part# is 20-3698-1. It is an adjustable flange plate. Our Bid includes 2 RFE12 (wheel balancers), 2 #20-3698-1 (flange plates), 2 #20-3116-1 (medium duty collet kits) and 2 #20-1207-1 (truck cone kits). If only 1 #20-3698-1, 1 #20-3116-1 and 1 #20-1207-1 is needed, please deduct 2,961 from the bid price.

See Quote Detail Attached.

Bidder Name: L Allen Auto Supply Co Inc

Bid #: 8100-W4

AUTOMOTIVE TECHNOLOGY BID PRICING PAGE

Item No.	Est. Qty	Description	MFG. / MODEL #	Unit Price	Total Price
1	2	1/2 11pc shallow socket set	SNAP-ON 111TMMIDY	\$127.80	\$255.60
2	2	1/2 11pc deep socket set	SNAP-ON 111STMMIDY	\$183.60	\$367.20
3	2	1/2 12pc shallow socket set	SNAP-ON 212FMY	\$148.10	\$296.20
4	2	1/2 12pc socket set	SNAP-ON 212FSMY	\$148.20	\$296.40
5	2	13pc met combo wrench set	SNAP-ON OSHMT713	\$353.55	\$707.10
6	2	BATTERY CHARGER PLUS	SNAP-ON EEBCS008	\$850.50	\$1,701.00
7	4	BATTERY CHARGER WITH CEC	SNAP-ON EEBCL00A	\$314.30	\$1,257.20
8	1	APOLLO D9 CERTIFICATION KIT Apollo cert training	SNAP-ON APD9CERTKIT	\$33,085.59	\$33,085.59
9	1	METER CERT KIT W/EDM596F METER CERT TRAINING	SNAP-ON 596FMETERKIT	\$16,382.03	\$16,382.03
10	3	TORQUE CERT KIT SECONDARY TORQUE CERT TRAINING	SNAP-ON TORQCERTKITS	\$39,360.00	\$39,360.00
11	1	PRECISION MSRMENT CERT KIT V2 PRECISION CERT TRAINING	SNAP-ON PMICERTKIT2	\$37,833.16	\$37,833.16
12	1	BATT START CHARG-SECONDARY BATT CERT TRAINING	SNAP-ON BSCCERS50	No Bid	No Bid
13	2	BATTERY CHARGER PLUS - LIFEPO4	SNAP-ON EEBCS008	\$850.50	\$1,701.00
14	2	BATTERY SYSTEM TESTER W/PRINT	SNAP-ON EEC5750A	\$969.50	\$1,939.00
15	2	Tool sets w/FOAM & ETCH SET	SNAP-ON 9400GMBO'S	\$31,175.53	\$62,351.06
16	1	Tool set w/FOAM & ETCH SET	SNAP-ON 9300GMBO	\$23,801.01	\$23,801.01
17	1	Build-a-Bay		\$198,000.00	\$198,000.00
18	12	TIL 42XL XL PIGSKIN MIG GLV	Tillman		
19	12	TIL 42M MID PIGSKIN MIG GLV	Tillman		
20	10	110LB IN 1170S6023 ER 70S 0.023x11LB SPOOL	ER 70S		
21	2	VIC0384-2126 PERFORMER 540/300 EDGE	Victor Performer VIC0384-2126		
22	12	UBWAH800D-TCXL WASHINGTON ALLOYS ULTRAVIEW PLUS	UBWAH800D-TCXL		
23	6	UBWAH800TC WASHINGTON ALLOYS KLEARVIEW HELMET	UBWAH800TC		
24	4	MIL951601 PKG MILLERMATIC 141 W/RUNNING GEAR/CYLIN	MIL951601 PKG MILLERMATIC 141		
25	1	MIL 951603 PKG MILLERMATIC 211 W/RUNNING GEAR/CYLIN	MIL 951603 PKG MILLERMATIC 211		
26	50	MILT-MO23 CONTACT TIP ACCULOCK MDX 023	MILT-MO23		
27	10	MILAS-M1200C MDX100 NZL ASY 1/2 ORFC	MILAS-M1200C MDX100		
28	5	MILD-M100 DIFF ACCULOCK MDX MDX-100	MILD-M100		
29	2	MIL1770028 MDX-100 10FT .030-.035 ACCULUCK MDX	MIL1770028		
30	5	MILLM2A-10 LINER 030-.035 10' MDX-100	MILLM2A-10		
31	2	POWERMAX30 XP SYSTEM 120-240V 1-PH CSA	HYP088079		

Snap-on Industrial, a Division of IDSC Holdings LLC

Bidder Name:

Bid #: 8100-W4

AUTOMOTIVE TECHNOLOGY BID PRICING PAGE

Item No.	Est. Qty	Description	MFG. / MODEL #	Unit Price	Total Price
32	6	SHIELD DURAMAX LT, 15-30A	HYP420116		
33	6	RETAINING CAP, DURAMAX LT, 15-30A	HYP420114		
34	15	NOZZLE DURAMAX LT 15-30A STANDARD CU	HYP420118		
35	15	ELECTRODE DURAMAX LT, 15-30A	HYP420120		
36	15	WIRL RING DURAMAX LT, 15-30A	HYP420211		
37	1	RTI AC RRR MACHINE	#4608044500		
38	1	LMP DSP CABINET MINIATURE			
39	4	NLE 3 5 TON SERVICE JACK	#7916420		
40	1	Abrasive SAND BLAST CABINET	Cyclone Model 4826		
41	1	AIR OVER HYDRAULIC HD OIL FILTER CRUSHER	OTC Model 1877		
42	1	AMA 50-TON PNEUMATIC SHOP PRESS	#HSP-50-A		
43	4	BK OIL DRAIN	#815-1266		
44	2	NLE RAM KIT 4 TON	#791-3575		
45	1	CHT DUAL EVAP	DEVAK		
46	2	DHC HD TESTER W PRINTER	#CBT6000HD		
47	4	SOR JUMP STARTER	#CIS12V600A		
48	4	BK TITANIUM DRILL BIT -29P	# TD29		
49	4	MIL IMPACT WRENCH	#2767-22GR		
50	4	MIL M18 IMPDR	#2953-22		
51	4	MIL M81 HMR DRILL	#2903-22		
52	4	MIL RECIPROCATING SAW	#2821-21		
53	2	MIL GRINDER	#288022		
54	4	MIL POLISHER	#2738-20		
55	4	MIL HEAT GUN	#2688-20		
56	4	MIL WET DRY VACUUM	#0880-20		
57	4	DEALER CABINET ASST	#899-2426		
58	2	NTE UNIV HYD FLARING TOOL	#75-3200		
59	5	BK TWIN BULB DROP LIGHT	#7827107		

Bidder Name: Snap-on Industrial, a Division of IDSC Holdings LLC

Bid #: 8100-W4

AUTOMOTIVE TECHNOLOGY BID PRICING PAGE

Item No.	Est. Qty	Description	MFG. / MODEL #	Unit Price	Total Price
60	4	ATD TPMS BACKPACK BUNDLE	NAPATPM5BP		
61	1	Fully Integrated Computerized Wheel Alignment Machine w/Lift Platform	Hunter Engineering Company Model #WA685, HE421CM, 20-2882-1, 20-2664-1, 20-2511-1, 20-2621-1, RX12KPSPR, 20-3438-1, 20-2801-1		
62	1	ADAS - Advanced Driver Assist Calibration Equipment	Hunter Engineering Company Model #DAS3000 KIT, ADASLINK SCAN TOOL		
63	2	Road Force Tire Balancer	Hunter Engineering Company Model #RFE12, 20-369-1, 20-3116-1, 20-1207-1		
64	1	Bench Brake Lathe, Combination Razor and Drum Lathe	Hunter Engineering Company Model #BL73, 20-2615-1, 175-423-2		
65	1	Automotive Tire Changer #1	Hunter Engineering Company Model #TCA34R, RPB-G1000A87, 20-2341-1		
66	1	Automotive Tire Changer #2	Hunter Engineering Company Model #TC95SW, RPB-G1000A87, 20-2341-1		

Bidder Name: Snap-on Industrial, a Division of IDSC Holdings LLC

AUTOMOTIVE TECHNOLOGY BID PRICING PAGE

Item No.	Est. Qty	Description	MFG. / MODEL #	Unit Price	Total Price	NAPA PART NUMBER
37	1	RTI AC RRR MACHINE	#4608044500	\$4,199.00	\$4,199.00	4608044500
38	1	LMP DSP CABINET MINIATURE	NAPA Lighting	\$186.41	\$186.41	CAPSCABN
39	4	NLE 3.5 TON SERVICE JACK	#7916420	\$274.00	\$1,096.00	7916420
40	1	Abrasive SAND BLAST CABINET	Cyclone Model 4826	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	
41	1	AIR OVER HYDRAULIC HD OIL FILTER CRUSHER	OTC Model 1877	\$4,800.00	\$4,800.00	1877
42	1	AMA 50-TON PNEUMATIC SHOP PRESS	#HSP-50-A	\$4,329.00	\$4,329.00	1004828
43	4	BK. OIL DRAIN	#815-1266	\$315.00	\$1,260.00	8151266
44	2	NLE RAM KIT 4 TON	#791-3575	\$355.00	\$710.00	7913575
45	1	CHT DUAL EVAP	DEVTAK	\$2,775.00	\$2,775.00	DEVTAK
46	2	DHC HD TESTER W PRINTER	#CBT6000HD	\$545.29	\$1,090.58	CBT6000HD
47	4	SOR JUMP STARTER	#CJS12V600A	\$249.00	\$996.00	CJS12V600A
48	4	BK TITANIUM DRILL BIT -29P	# TD29	\$95.06	\$380.24	TD29
49	4	MIL IMPACT WRENCH	#2767-22GR	\$499.00	\$1,996.00	2767-22GR
50	4	MIL M18 IMPDR	#2953-22	\$309.00	\$1,236.00	2953-22
51	4	MIL M81 HMR DRILL	#2903-22	\$319.99	\$1,279.96	2903-22
52	4	MIL RECIPROCATING SAW	#2821-21	\$378.99	\$1,515.96	2821-21
53	2	MIL GRINDER	#288022	\$449.99	\$899.98	288022
54	4	MIL POLISHER	#2738-20	\$301.99	\$1,207.96	273820
55	4	MIL HEAT GUN	#2688-20	\$151.99	\$607.96	268820
56	4	MIL WET DRY VACUUM	#0880-20	\$99.99	\$399.96	88020
57	4	DEALER CABINET ASST	#899-2426	\$571.06	\$2,284.24	8992426
58	2	NTE UNIV HYD FLARING TOOL	#78-3200	\$625.00	\$1,250.00	783200
59	5	BK TWIN BULB DROP LIGHT	#7827107	\$25.00	\$125.00	7827107
60	4	ATD TPMS BACKPACK BUNDLE	NAPATPMSBP	\$1,502.54	\$6,010.16	NAPATPMSBP
			Hunter Engineering Company Model			
62	1	ADAS -Advanced Driver Assist Calibration Equipment	#DAS3000 KIT, ADASLINK SCAN TOOL	\$29,500.00	\$29,500.00	DAS30001
62	1	ADAS -Advanced Driver Assist Calibration Equipment	AUTEL ADAS IA900AST	\$29,485.00	\$29,485.00	IA900AST

Napa Auto Parts

AUTOMOTIVE TECHNOLOGY BID PRICING PAGE

Item No.	Est. Qty	Description	MFG. / MODEL #	Unit Price	Total Price
1	2	1/4 11pc shallow socket set	SNAP-ON 111TMDY		
2	2	1/4 11pc deep socket set	SNAP-ON 111STMDY		
3	2	1/4 12pc shallow socket set	SNAP-ON 212FMY		
4	2	1/4 12pc socket set	SNAP-ON 212FSMY		
5	2	13pc met combo wrench set	SNAP-ON OSHM713		
6	2	BATTERY CHARGER PLUS	SNAP-ON EEBC500B		
7	4	BATTERY CHARGER WITH CEC	SNAP-ON EEBC100A		
8	1	APOLLO D9 CERTIFICATION KIT Apollo cert training	SNAP-ON APD9CERTKIT		
9	1	METER CERT KIT W/EEEM596F METER CERT TRAINING	SNAP-ON 596FMETERKIT		
10	1	TORQUE CERT KIT SECONDARY TORQUE CERT TRAINING	SNAP-ON TORQCERTKITS		
11	1	PRECISION MSRMENT CERT KIT V2 PRECISION CERT TRAINING	SNAP-ON PMICERTKIT2		
12	1	BATT START CHARG-SECONDARY BATT CERT TRAINING	SNAP-ON BSCCERT550		
13	2	BATTERY CHARGER PLUS - LIFEPO4	SNAP-ON EEBC500B		
14	2	BATTERY SYSTEM TESTER W/PRINT	SNAP-ON EEC5750A		
15	2	Tool sets W/FOAM & ETCH SET	SNAP-ON 9400GMBO'S		
16	1	Tool set W/FOAM & ETCH SET	SNAP-ON 9300GMBO		
17	1	Build-a-Bay			
18	12	TIL 42XL XL PIGSKIN MIG GLV	Tillman	18.86	226.32
19	12	TIL 42M MD PIGSKIN MIG GLV	Tillman	18.86	226.32
20	10	110LB IN 1170S6023 ER 705 0.023+11LB SPOOL	ER 705	2.89	317.90
21	2	VICO384-2126 PERFORMER 540/300 EDGE	Victor Performer VICO384-2126	521.52	1043.04
22	12	LIBWAH800D-TCXL WASHINGTON ALLOYS ULTRAVIEW PLUS	LIBWAH800D-TCXL	187.20	2246.40
23	6	LIBWAH800TC WASHINGTON ALLOYS KLEARVIEW HELMET	LIBWAH800TC	118.83	709.98
24	4	MIL951601 PKG MILLERMATIC 141 W/RUNNING GEAR/CYLIN	MIL951601 PKG MILLERMATIC 141	1247.36	4989.44
25	1	MIL 951603 PKG MILLERMATIC 211 W/RUNNING GEAR/CYLIN	MIL 951603 PKG MILLERMATIC 211	2085.16	2085.16
26	50	MILT-MO23 CONTACT TIP,ACCULOCK MDX .023	MILT-MO23	2.32	116.00
27	10	MILNS-M1200C MDX100 NZL ASY, 1/2 ORFC	MILNS-M1200C MDX100	21.00	210.00
28	5	MILD-M100 DIFF,ACCULOCK MDX,MDX-100	MILD-M100 'MUST BE ORDERED IN TWO PACKS ONLY)	15.45	92.70
29	2	MIL1770028 MDX-100.10FT .030-.035 ACCULUCK MDX	MIL1770028	285.70	571.40
30	5	MILLM2A-10 LINER.030-.035 '10'MDX-100	MILLM2A-10	25.89	129.45

Bidder Name:

ARGAS USA LLC

AUTOMOTIVE TECHNOLOGY BID PRICING PAGE

Item No.	Est. Qty	Description	MFG. / MODEL #	Unit Price	Total Price
31	2	POWERMAX30 XP SYSTEM 120-240V 1-PH CSA	HYP088079	1750.00	3500.00

Bidder Name: AIRGAS USA LLC

AUTOMOTIVE TECHNOLOGY BID PRICING PAGE

Item No.	Est. Qty	Description	MFG. / MODEL #	Unit Price	Total Price
32	6	SHIELD, DURAMAX LT, 15-30A	HYP420116	17.10	102.60
33	6	RETAINING CAP, DURAMAX LT, 15-30A	HYP420114	30.75	184.50
34	15	NOZZLE, DURAMAX LT 15-30A STANDARD CU	HYP420118	8.30	124.50
35	15	ELECTRODE, DURAMAX LT, 15-30A	HYP420120	8.80	132.00
36	15	WIRL RING, DURAMAX LT, 15-50A	HYP420211	20.10	301.50
37	1	RTI AC RRR MACHINE	#4608044500		
38	1	LMP DSP CABINET MINIATURE			
39	4	NLE 3.5 TON SERVICE JACK	#7916420		
40	1	Abrasive SAND BLAST CABINET	Cyclone Model 4826		
41	1	AIR OVER HYDRAULIC HD OIL FILTER CRUSHER	OTC Model 1877		
42	1	AMA 50-TON PNEUMATIC SHOP PRESS	#HSP-50-A		
43	4	BK. OIL DRAIN	#815-1266		
44	2	NLE RAM KIT 4 TON	#791-3575		
45	1	CHT DUAL EVAP	DEVTAK		
46	2	DHC HD TESTER W/ PRINTER	#CBT6000HD		
47	4	SOR JUMP STARTER	#CJS12V600A		
48	4	BK TITANIUM DRILL BIT -29P	# TD29		
49	4	MIL IMPACT WRENCH	#2767-22GR	601.00	2404.00
50	4	MIL M18 IMPDR	#2953-22	556.00	2224.00
51	4	MIL M81 HMR DRILL	#2903-22	537.00	2148.00
52	4	MIL RECIPROCATING SAW	#2821-21	580.00	3220.00
53	2	MIL GRINDER	#288022	792.00	1584.00
54	4	MIL POLISHER	#2738-20	497.00	1988.00
55	4	MIL HEAT GUN	#2688-20	248.00	992.00
56	4	MIL WET DRY VACUUM	#0880-20	220.00	880.00
57	4	DEALER CABINET ASST	#899-2426		
58	2	NTE UNIV HYD FLARING TOOL	#78-3200		
59	5	BK TWIN BULB DROP LIGHT	#7827107		

Bidder Name: AMT GAS USA LLC

AUTOMOTIVE TECHNOLOGY BID PRICING PAGE

Item No.	Est. Qty	Description	MFG. / MODEL #	Unit Price	Total Price
60	4	ATD TPMS BACKPACK BUNDLE	NAPATPMSBP		
61	1	Fully Integrated Computerized Wheel Alignment Machine w/Lift Platform	Hunter Engineering Company Model #WA685, HE421CM, 20-2882-1, 20-2664-1, 20-2511-1, 20-2621-1, RX12KFSPRR, 20-3438-1, 20-2801-1		
62	1	ADAS -Advanced Driver Assist Calibration Equipment	Hunter Engineering Company Model #DAS3000 KIT, ADASLINK SCAN TOOL		
63	2	Road Force Tire Balancer	Hunter Engineering Company Model #RFE12, 20-369-1, 20-3116-1, 20-1207-1		
64	1	Bench Brake Lathe, Combination Rotor and Drum Lathe	Hunter Engineering Company Model #BL73, 20-2615-1, 175-423-2		
65	1	Automotive Tire Changer #1	Hunter Engineering Company Model #TCA34R, RP6-G1000A87, 20-2341-1		
66	1	Automotive Tire Changer #2	Hunter Engineering Company Model #TC39SSW, RPG-G1000A87, 20-2341-1		

Bidder Name: AIR GAS USA LLC