Fall Athletic Equipment
Bid # 7863-W3

Item # | Unit Description Bidder / Unit Price Bidder / Unit Price Bidder / Unit Price Bidder / Unit Price Bidder / Unit Price Bidder / Unit Price
BSN Sports Winning Teams by Nissen | Grogan Macriano Sports * Bill Fritz Sports Pyramid School Products * Riddell / All American
Integrated Padded Football Girdles. Must include hip, tail, thigh padding.
1 ea. |Sizes include: 50 med, 50 large, 50 XL, 50 XXL $28.98 $27.45 $22.24 no bid $21.25 $33.80
Varsity High School Football Practice Pants. Sizes include 50 small, 50
2 ea. |med, 75 large,50 XL, 50 XXL, 25 XXXL $12.16 $19.65 $14.95 no bid $11.95 $14.10
3 ea. |Varsity Football Belts. White $0.68 $0.83 $1.22 no bid $0.87 $1.30
4 pair | Volleyball Knee Pads. Sizes include: 50 s/m, 50 L/XL. White $12.58 $8.75 $11.45 no bid $9.98 no bid
Varsity Volleyballs. Mikasa VFC 1000. Official Ball of the MIAA and NFHS
5 ea. |approved $59.98 no bid $49.95 no bid $48.00 no bid
6 pair | Varsity All Sport one color Soccer Socks White. $2.48 $2.40 $2.91 no bid $1.90 $6.25
Varsity All Sport one color Soccer Socks. 200 Scarlet Red, 100 Maroon,
7 pair 100 Forest Green, 100 Orange, 100 Black, 100 Royal Blue. $2.48 $2.40 $2.91 no bid $1.90 $6.25
8 ea. |High School Field Hockey Scoring Books. $8.48 no bid $5.95 no bid no bid no bid
Varsity High School Football Helmets. Must meet NOCSAE standards.
Shells must be 2022. Must be 5 Star Virginia Tech Football rated for safety.
Facemasks must be attached. Facemasks must coincide with 2022 shells.
Chin straps must be included. Colors and sizes include: 3 Forest Green
(Metallic) with White Facemasks. Size Large; 10 Vegas Gold with White
Facemasks Sizes include 5 Med, 5 Large; 1 White with White Facemask.
Size Large; 14 Extra Bright Silver Helmet with Seattle Blue Facemask.
Sizes include 7 Med. 7 Large; 9 Black (Impregnated) with Gray Facemasks.
9 ea. |Sizesinclude 4 Large, 5 XL. no bid no bid $270.00 - $ 365.00 no bid no bid $285.00
Adult Varsity High School Shoulder Pads. Must be 2022 Model (all
purpose). Flat pad design. Corrugated arches and epaulets. Bodies must be
10 ea. |removable and adjustable. Sizes include 1 Small, 4 Med, 7 Large, 2 XL. no bid no bid $225.00 no bid no bid $255.00
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Orange Field Hockey Balls. NFHS and MIAA approved. Official size and 4.41 each $ 52.95 per

11 ea. |weight. 3.28 each 39.36 per dozen $2.79 dozen no bid $2.29 no bid
White Field Hockey Balls. NFHS and MIAA approved. Official size and 4.41 each $ 52.95 per

12 ea. |weight. $3.44 $2.79 dozen no bid $2.29 no bid
Practice Field Hockey Balls. Molded composite plastic construction for $ 3.58 each $42.95 per

13 ea. |external use. Official size and weight for High School Field Hockey. 2.68 each, 32.16 per dozen no bid dozen no bid $1.96 no bid
Air Mesh Field Hockey Goalie Jerseys. Sizes include 4 Med, 4 Large, 4 XL.

14 ea. |Colors Light Blue or Pink. no bid no bid $24.95 no bid no bid no bid
Soccer Goalie Gloves. High School Adult White latex foam palm for grip
and durability. Gusseted fingers for comfort and ball control. Hook and loop

15 pair |closure. Sizes include 9 Small, 9 Med, 9 Large, 9 XL. $38.84 no bid $45.00 no bid $26.95 no bid
Field Hockey Goals Kwik Goal Official Field Hockey Goals. Constructed on
2" x 3" white powder coated heavy-gauge aluminum with a mill finish.
Official size 7' H x 12' W x 4' 4 5/8 Base and 3' Top. Features one piece

16 pair |welded side. $4,599.98 $4,715.00 $2,115.50 $4,290.95 $4,195.00 $3,233.33
Integrated Padded Football Pants. Black. Must include knee hip, tail, and

17 pair |thigh padding. Sizes include 10 Med, 10 Large, 10 XL, 10 XXL, 10 XXXL. no bid $21.15 $36.70 no bid $23.90 $20.80

18 pair | Varsity High School Football Knee Pads. $3.64 no bid $4.30 no bid $4.99 $7.25

* bidder indicates cannot meet delivery deadline
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